
Exhibit X

Line Fee Title Fee Amount Government Code Justification

1 Countywide Internal Fees

2 Photocopy Fees

3 $0.10 Each

4 Printing Fees

5 A-87 Actual costs A-87 Actual costs

6 Postage Fees

7 A-87 Actual costs A-87 Actual costs

8 Returned Check Fees

9 $25.00 Actual Costs - Merchant charges and handling

10 Auditor Fees

11 Earnings Withholding Order Processing $1.50 CCP Sec. 706.034

12 Check Stub Copy $1.00

13 Duplicate Copy of W-2 $8.00

14 Facsimile Fees

15 Local

16 First page $1.50

17 Each additional page $0.75

18 Long Distance

19 Each additional page $1.00

20 Agriculture

21 Site visit/Consultation $25.00 Reso. No. 11-072

22
Small animal trap placement & service (Up to 30 days per property for 

Raccoon, Skunk, Bobcat, Fox, Opossum, Coyote, other)
$75.00 Reso. No. 13-042 

23
Large animal trap placement & service (Up to 20 days per property for 

Bear, Lion, Feral Hog, other)
$125.00 Reso. No. 13-042 

24 Ranch service agreement - 1 year $500.00 Reso. No. 11-072

25 Ranch service agreement - 1 month $100.00 Reso. No. 11-072

26 Water Submeter Testing by Owner Request $50.00 Sec. 12210 B&P

27 Third Party Certifier Annual Application Fee $1,000.00

28 Annual MSF Certification Program Fee $970.00

29 Hourly Inspection Fee $82.91

30 Pest Condition and Pest Treatment

31 State Phytosanitary Certificates

32 Minimum Charge (1 Certificate) $10.00 Sec. 5202 CFAC

33 Number of Certificates (2-3) $15.00 Sec. 5202 CFAC

34 Number of Certificates (4-6) $20.00 Sec. 5202 CFAC

35 Number of Certificates (7-9) $25.00 Sec. 5202 CFAC

36 Number of Certificates (10 +)
Specialist's hourly wage, including benefits, plus 

$.485/mile
Sec. 5202 CFAC

37 Federal Phytosanitary Certificates

38 Certificate No Fee Sec. 5202 CFAC

39 Agricultural Standard Specialist's time (per hour) $48.73 Sec. 5202 CFAC

40 Mileage (per mile) $0.49 Sec. 5202 CFAC

41 Certificates of Quarantine Compliance

42 Minimum Charge (1 Certificate) $5.00 Sec. 5202 CFAC

43 Number of Certificates (2-6) $10.00 Sec. 5202 CFAC

44 Number of Certificates (7-12) $15.00 Sec. 5202 CFAC

45 Number of Certificates (13-19) $20.00 Sec. 5202 CFAC

46 Number of Certificates (20 +)
Specialist's hourly weighted rate plus $.485/mile (if travel 

necessary)
Sec. 5202 CFAC

47 Certification of Pest Treatment

48

For Supervision of fumigation, cold storage, dip or other treatments and 

certification pursuant to CFAC, Federal Quarantine Regulations or 

County Ordinance

Specialist's hourly weighted rate plus $.485/mile

49 Regulatory Trapping

50
To comply with quarantines involving other foreign countries, states, and 

counties

Agricultural Field Inspector's hourly weighted rate plus 

$.485/mile, plus cost of traps
51 Registration of Pesticide Licenses

52 Licensed Qualified Applicator $25.00 Sec. 11734 CFAC

53 Licensed Maintenance Gardener $25.00 Sec. 11734 CFAC

54
Licensed Pest Control Pilot Registering in person for the first time in 

current year
$10.00 Sec. 11923 CFAC

55 Licensed Pest Control Pilot Already registered in another County $5.00 Sec. 11923 CFAC

56
Licensed Pest Control Advisor Registering in person for the first time in 

current year
$10.00 Sec. 12034 CFAC

57
Licensed Pest Control Advisor already registered in another county for 

current year
$5.00 Sec. 12034 CFAC

58 Licensed Structural Pest Control Operator $10.00 Sec. 15204 CFAC

59 Weighing and Measuring Device Inspection

60 Tests for Non-commercial inspection Sec. 12210 B&P

61 Tests for Commercial Devices upon request from owner when testing could be performed by a registered repairman Sec. 12210.5 B&P

62

63 Small Capacity Scales (up to 10,000 GVW)

64 Per Hour $85.00

65 Per Mile $1.50

66 Large Capacity Scales (10,000 to 40,000 GVW)

67 Per Hour $100.00

68 Per Mile $2.00

69 Large Capacity Scales (more than 40,000 GVW)

70 Per Hour $130.00

71 Per Mile $2.50

72 Retail Gasoline Dispensers

73 Per Hour $70.00

74 Per Mile $0.75

75 Wholesale Petroleum Meters

76 Per Hour $70.00

77 Per Mile $1.00

78 Liquefied Petroleum Gas Meters

79 Per Hour $70.00

80 Per Mile $0.85

81 All Other Commercial Devices

82 Per Hour $70.00

83 Per Mile $1.00

84 Bee Charges

85 Certification for Exportation of Bees on Comb Specialist/s hourly wage, plus benefits, and $.485/mile Secs. 29141, 29143 CFAC

86 Certification of Colony Strength Specialist/s hourly wage, plus benefits, and $.485/mile Sec. 29195 CFAC

87 Registration of Apiary $10.00 Secs. 29040, 29043, 29044 CFAC

88 Fruit, Nut, and Vegetable Certificates

89 Certification for other state or country $20.00 Sec. 42793 CFAC

90 Certified Producer Certificate $25.00 Reso. No. 13-042, 1392.8 CCR

91 Certified Farmer's Market Certificate $25.00 Sec. 1392.8 CCR

92 Fresh Fruit & Vegetable Wholesaler Registration $5.00 Sec. 43061 CFAC

93 Commercial Fruit & Vegetable Inspector Registration $5.00 Sec. 57302 CFAC

94
Determination of Soluble Solids for Grapes for Wine and Byproducts 

(minimum charge 4 hours)
Agricultural Field Inspector's weighted hourly rate Sec. 41164 CFAC

95 Farm Labor Contractors

96 Farm Labor Contractor Registration $25.00 Sec. 1695 CLC, Sec. 12999.5(d) CFAC

County of Mendocino Master Fee Schedule

Charges for travel, stand-by, and return call charges for a second test in the same calendar year.

DRAFT-REVISED JULY 12, 2021 1 Adopted by Resolution No. 21-XXX, Fees Effective as of August 15, 2021



Exhibit X

Line Fee Title Fee Amount Government Code Justification

County of Mendocino Master Fee Schedule

97 Reproduction/Transmission of Records

98 Computerized 3.5 inch Floppy diskette Minimum Charge $0.60

99 Computerized Tape Cartridge $14.00

100 Facsimile Transmissions (for public use of the machine)

101 First page $2.50

102 Each additional page $1.50

103 Copies Made - Legal Size (8 1/2 x 14 or smaller) (per page) $0.10

104 Copies Made - Ledger Size (11 x 17) (per page) $0.20

105

106 Administration of a Field Representative Examination $15.00 Sec. 1948(a)(8) B&P

107 State Fees Collected by Mendocino County

108 Device Administrative Fee (Water, Vapor, & Electric submeters) $0.10 Reso. No. 12-088, B&P 12027, 12107, 12241

109 Device Administrative Fee (Small scales, meters & dispensers) $1.10 Reso. No. 12-088, B&P 12027, 12107, 12241

110 Device Administrative Fee (Liquid gas meters, heavy capacity scales) $8.00 Reso. No. 12-088, B&P 12027, 12107, 12241

111 Device Administrative Fee (Vehicle scales) $12.00 Reso. No. 12-088, B&P 12027, 12107, 12241

112 State Export Certification $5.30 Reso. No. 12-088, CCR 4603(i)

113 Master Permit $125.00 Reso. No. 12-088, CCR 4603(i)

114 Air Quality Management District

115 Please Refer to Air Quality Management District Website

116 Animal Care & Control

117 Adoption – Canine/Feline (plus any vaccination fees) $40.00 F&Ag 31108

118 Spay/Neuter Fee $20.00

119 Spay/Neuter Refundable Deposit $75.00 Reso No. 10-149, F&Ag 30503

120 Canine License:

121 Altered $25.00 Reso. No. 11-073, FA 30804.5, 30652

122 Unaltered $55.00 Reso. No. 11-073,  FA 30801

123 3-Year License $150.00

124 3-Year S/N License $60.00

125 Duplicate License/Tag $5.00 FA 30502, 30803

126 Transfer Fee $4.00

127 Delinquent Licensing Penalty $30.00

128 Delinquent Licensing Penalty - Unaltered $60.00

129 Potentially Dangerous/Vicious Dog License $100.00 FA 31641

130 Impound/Redemption Fee - Unaltered:

131 1st Offense $70.00 FA 31251

132 2nd Offense $100.00 FA 31251

133 3rd Offense $140.00 FA 31251

134 Each offense after 3rd w/in 2 yr. period $160.00 FA 31251

135 Impound/Redemption Fee - Altered:

136 1st Offense $45.00 FA 31251

137 2nd Offense $75.00 FA 31251

138 3rd Offense $115.00 FA 31251

139 Each offense after 3rd w/in 2 yr. period $135.00 FA 31251

140 Protective Custody Hold
All fees, charges or costs for impoundment plus feed, care, 

and vet fees (if required)
Reso. No. 96-106, FA 31251

141 Non-Commercial Residential Kennel:

142 05 - 10 Canines $100.00 Reso. No. 11-073, FA 30807

143 11 - 20 Canines $190.00 Reso. No. 11-073, FA 30807

144 21 - 50 Canines $340.00 Reso. No. 11-073, FA 30807

145 Delinquent Penalty Double Fee FA 30807

146 Certified Agricultural Kennel:

147 05 - 10 Canines $50.00

148 11 - 20 Canines $110.00

149 21 – 50 Canines $210.00

150 Delinquent Penalty Double Fee

151 Commercial Kennel License: $200.00

152 Delinquent Penalty $50.00

153 Re-Inspection Fee $50.00

154 Feed & Care Fee (Canine) (per day) $20.60 Reso. No. 10-149, CIV 1834, PC 597e

155 Feed & Care Fee (Feline) (per day) $20.60 Reso. No. 10-149, CIV 1834, PC 597e

156 Feed & Care Fee (Quarantine Animals) (per day) $24.90 Reso. No. 10-149

157 Feed & Care Fee (Other Animals/Livestock) Actual Cost

158 Trap Rental (per week) $5.00

159 Refundable Trap Deposit $40.00

160 Vicious PDA (Potentially Dangerous Animal) Hearing Fee $300.00

161 Handling of Large Animal Actual Cost

162 Veterinarian Treatment Actual Cost

163 Emergency Call-Out
$25.00 per man hour ($75.00 minimum on call backs + 

.375¢ per mile)
164 Stray Animal Brought to Shelter No fees

165 Owner Animal Surrender at Shelter $40.00

166 Owner Animal Surrender at Shelter from Out of County $103.00 Reso. No. 10-149

167 Owner Animal Surrender at Shelter for Euthanasia $15.00

168 Pick Up of Owned Animal $40.00

169 Owner Animal Surrender at Shelter w/Litter $40.00

170 Small Animal Carcass Removal $25.00

171 Incineration of Animal $52.90 Reso. No. 10-149

172 Home Quarantine Inspection $50.00 HS 121595, 121600, 121610 CCR

173 Shelter Quarantine/Isolation
All impound/redemption, feed/care and any other 

vaccination or vet fees
174 Exotic Animal Permit $200.00

175 Delinquent Penalty $50.00

176 Heartworm Test – Canine $20.00

177 Pure Vax $10.00

178 DHLPP Vaccine $13.00 Reso. No. 11-073

179 FVRCP Vaccine $13.00 Reso. No. 11-073

180 RABIES Vaccine $10.00 Reso. No. 14-047

181 BORDATELLA Vaccine $13.00 Reso. No. 11-073

182 LYME Vaccine $12.00

183 FELV Vaccine $11.00

184 FELV Test $15.00

185 FELV/FIV Test $25.00

186 Microchip $15.00

187 Feline Carriers $5.00

188 Tee Shirts $10.00

189 Tee Max Shirt $15.00

190 Feline Neuter $40.00 Reso. No. 11-073, FA 30520

191 Feline Spay $60.00 Reso. No. 11-073, FA 30520

192 Canine Neuter (Under 40 lbs.) $75.00 Reso. No. 11-073, FA 30520

193 Canine Neuter (Over 40 lbs.) $85.00 Reso. No. 11-073, FA 30520

194 Canine Spay (Under 40 lbs.) $90.00 Reso. No. 11-073, FA 30520

195 Canine Spay (Over 40 lbs.) $100.00 Reso. No. 11-073, FA 30520

196 In Heat/Pregnant (Additional) $10.00

Structural Pest Control License Applicants Exam Fee

DRAFT-REVISED JULY 12, 2021 2 Adopted by Resolution No. 21-XXX, Fees Effective as of August 15, 2021



Exhibit X

Line Fee Title Fee Amount Government Code Justification

County of Mendocino Master Fee Schedule

197 Basic Exam $30.00

198 IV Fluids $20.00

199 Additional Fluids (per bag) $7.00

200 Nursing Care (per day) $30.00

201 Sedation (Under 40lbs) $40.00

202 Sedation (Over 40lbs) $60.00

203 Anesthesia (Under 40lbs) $40.00

204 Anesthesia (Over 40lbs) $60.00

205 Cephazolin Injection $10.00

206 Antibiotics (per prescription) $10.00

207 Wound Treatment (per minute) $2.00

208 Suture (per pack) $7.00

209 Eye/Ear Exam $15.00

210 Crypt Orchid (Small) $55.00

211 Crypt Orchid (Large) $65.00

212 Lab Work (Canine) $54.00

213 Lab Work (Feline) $65.00

214 Ear Mite Treatment and Flush $14.00

215 Pregnancy (Abortion) (Over 40days) $20.00

216 Worming – Droncit (per tablet) $7.00

217 PARVO Test $20.00

218 RVT Rate Actual Cost and Time

219 Vet Rate Actual Cost and Time
220 After Hours Fee (3 HRS. MIN. ) Rate x Time (Hourly rate; then hourly x rate)
221 X-Rays Actual Cost

222 Ultrasound Actual Cost

223 Heartworm Preventative (Small Canine) $15.00

224 Heartworm Preventative (Medium Canine) $30.00

225 Heartworm Preventative (Large Canine) $40.00

226 Fecal Test $20.00

227 Protective Collar 7.5” $5.00

228 Protective Collar 15” $5.50

229 Protective Collar 25” $6.00

230 Bitter Orange (1ounce) $4.00

231 Bitter Orange (2ounce) $5.00

232 Flea Drops Canine 1-10 lbs. $10.00

233 Flea Drops Canine 11-20 lbs. $10.50

234 Flea Drops Canine 21-55 lbs. $10.75

235 Flea Drops Canine Over 55 lbs. $11.00

236 Flea Drops Feline Under 9 lbs. $10.00

237 Flea Drops Feline Over 9 LBS. $10.50

238 Assessor/Clerk-Recorder

239 Assessor Fees

240 Maps & Labels

241 Assessor Plat Maps $4.00

242 Plat Map Subscription (Annual) $225.00

243 Plat Map Updates for Subscribers $2.00

244 Plat Map, per page, full book $3.00

245 Archived Assessor's Maps, per page $6.00

246 Microfiche Copies $4.00

247 Photocopies of Map Index, per page $4.00

248 County Maps, each $5.00

249 Other

250 Comparable Sales List, Viewing $10.00

251 Brooktrails Block/Lot Index $35.00

252 Aerial Photo Deposit $190.00

253 Aerial Photo Index, Each $5.00

254 Aerial Photo Rental, Each (First 2 weeks) $5.00
255 Aerial Photo Rental, Late Fee, each work day/per photo $2.00
256 Aerial Photocopies, 2005-06 Fly Over only $4.00 - $6.00

257 Facsimile Charges, first page $1.50

258 Facsimile Charges, each additional page $1.00

259 Postage and Handling 30%

260 Screen Print $7.00

261 Property Characteristics, per parcel (Non-Owner) $10.00

262 Photocopies, per page $0.25

263 Research Time, Per Hour, with minimum of $22.00 $45.00

264 Certification of a Record $15.00

265 Filming of Complete Map Set, per map $2.00

266
Boundary Line Adjustment, Certificate of Compliance and Subdivisions up 

to four parcels

$165.00 for Subdivisions up to 4 parcels

+$50.00 for each additional parcel
267 Mobile Home Tax Clearance Certificate $25.00

268 Estimate of Lien, parcel divisions $18.00

269 Data Processing Services Actual Cost

270 Processing Fee for Parent-Child and Grandparent-Grandchild Exclusion $175.00 Sec 54985 GC

271 Clerk-Recorder Fees

272 Election Fees

273 Photocopy of Campaign and Conflict of Interest Statements (per page) $0.10 GC 81008

274 Non-Standard Photocopies (election result tapes) - Hourly Rate $86.31

275 Retrieval of statements 5 or more years old (per statement) $50.00 GC 81008

276 Labels of registered voters (per thousand) $36.00 EC 2190

277 Plus set up fee $40.00

278 Index of registered voters (per thousand) $28.00 EC 2190

279 Plus set up fee. $65.00

280 Certificate of Registration $16.00 EC 2167

281
Filing Notice of Intent of Initiative Petition (Fee will be refunded if 

petition is certified to be sufficient within one year of filing.)
$200.00 EC 9103

282 Sale of Electronic Voter Registration Information With History $225.00

283 Without History $200.00

284 Plus set up fee for each $25.00

285 Minimum Fee for Entities Not Going to Election $300.00

286 Absentee Lists

287 Set-up $65.00

288 Daily printing $26.00

289 Clerk Fees

290 Marriage License

291 Marriage license $85.00 GC 26840

292 Confidential marriage license $87.00 GC 26840.1, .8

293 Issuance of marriage license outside of normal business hours $65.00 GC 26840.2

294 Performance of marriage, during office hours $24.00 GC 26861

295 Certified copy of confidential marriage record $15.00 Fam 509, H&S 103640, 50,H&S 103625

296 Issuing duplicate/replacement license for marriage (public) $55.00 Fam 360

297 Issuing duplicate/replacement license for confidential marriage $56.00 Fam 510

298
Filing affidavit to amend confidential marriage certificate (one year or 

more after date of marriage)
$19.00 H&S 103700

DRAFT-REVISED JULY 12, 2021 3 Adopted by Resolution No. 21-XXX, Fees Effective as of August 15, 2021



Exhibit X

Line Fee Title Fee Amount Government Code Justification

County of Mendocino Master Fee Schedule

299
Approval of Notary public to authorize confidential marriages (effective 

one year)
$175.00 Fam 536

300 Fictitious Business License

301
Filing and indexing Fictitious Business Name Statement and one certified 

copy
$46.00 B&P 17929(a)

302 Each additional name on same statement (business and partner's names) $2.00 B&P 17929(a), (b)

303 Additional certified copy of Fictitious Business Name Statement $1.85 B&P 17926(b)

304
Filing and indexing a Statement of Abandonment of Fictitious Business 

Name Statement
$32.00 B&P 17929(c)

305 Filing and indexing a Statement of Withdrawal from Partnership $32.00 B&P 17929(d)

306
Affidavit of publication of Notice of dissolution of partnership per Corp. C 

15035.5
$2.25 GC 26850

307 Other

308 Searching records (per year, per name) $5.00 GC 26854

309 Copy Fees Per Page 8 1/2" X 11" To 8 1/2" X 14" $0.10

310 Documents Other Than 8 1/2" X 11" To 8 1/2" X 14" (Per Hour) $64.00

311 Certifying to a photocopy of any filed paper (per document) $1.75 GC 26833

312 Comparing (per page, in addition to fee for certifying) $8.00 GC 26837

313 Certificate for which fee is not otherwise fixed $1.75 GC 26836

314
Exemplification of photocopy of record (in addition to photocopying or 

comparing charges)
$20.00 GC 26839

315
Taking affidavit and/or acknowledgment, including Certificate, per 

signature
$2.25 GC 26853, 55

316 Certificate to official capacity of public official $2.25 GC 26852

317 Filing and indexing Auctioneer's Bond $2.00 GC 26849

318 Filing and entering appointment of Humane Officer $5.00 CC 607f

319

Filing, canceling, revoking, or withdrawing bond of Notary Public.  

Applicable recording fees made payable to the County Recorder also 

collected at the time of filing bond.

$25.00 GC 26849.1

320 Registration of Professional Process Server $100.00 B&P 22352

321
Filing, canceling, revoking or withdrawing Professional Process Servers 

bond
$13.00 B&P 22353(c)

322
Registration of Professional Photocopier, if not a Professional Process 

Server (plus bond)
$175.00 B&P 22453

323 Registration of Professional Photocopier, if a Professional Process Server $100.00 B&P 22453.1

324
Filing, canceling, revoking or withdrawing a Professional Photocopier 

bond
$13.00 B&P 22455(a)(2)

325 Each additional card regarding Professional Photocopier $10.00 B&P 22453

326
Filing and indexing of other papers for which a fee is not elsewhere 

provided
$2.25 GC 26850

327 Certificate in re certificate of authority issued by Insurance Commission $2.25 GC 26851

328 Filing a Power of Attorney for Admitted Surety Insurer $14.00 GC 26855.1

329
Filing a Power of Attorney for Admitted Surety Insurer, if more than one 

name on Power of Attorney (per additional name)
$2.25 GC 26855.1

330
Filing Notice of Cancellation, Revocation or Withdrawal of Power of 

Attorney for Admitted Surety Insurer
$5.50 GC 26855.1

331

Filing Notice of Cancellation, Revocation or Withdrawal of Power of 

Attorney for Admitted Surety Insurer, if more than one name on Notice 

(per name)

$2.25 GC 26855.1

332 Filing Financial Statement of Admitted Surety Insurer $3.50 GC 26855.2

333
Filing a Surrender, Revocation, Cancellation, Annulment or Suspension of 

Certificate of Surety
$3.50 GC 26855.3

334 Authentication of any document per court order (per signature) $2.00

335
Filing Notice of Determination re Negative Declaration pursuant to Pub. 

Resource Code 21080(c)
$50.00 plus $1,800.00 as set by State F&G 711.4(d)

336
Filing Notice of Determination re Environmental Impact Report prepared 

pursuant to California Environmental Quality Act
$50.00 plus $2,500.00 as set by State F&G 711.4(d)

337 CEQA filing requiring no fee to Department of Fish and Game $50.00 F&G 711.4(d)

338 Recorder Fees

339 Regular Recording Fees

340 First page (8½" x 11") $14.00 GC 27361

341 Each additional page $3.00 GC 27361

342
Additional recording fee for documents containing pages other than 8½" x 

11" fee per page for every page of entire document
$3.00 GC 27361

343 Penalty print (per page) $1.00 GC 27361

344
When two or more documents serially incorporated into one form, each 

will be considered as separate.
$13.00 for each document after first GC 27361

345 Release of lien by government agency $17.00 GC 27361.3

346 Military discharge No fee GC 27381

347
State or local governmental entity recording fee when document is for the 

benefit of the government entity
No fee GC 27383

348 Each additional reference indexed $1.00 GC 27361.2

349
Indexing documents with more than 10 names - for each additional 10 

names or fraction thereof
$1.00 GC 27361.8

350
Transfer of title documents recorded without Preliminary Change of 

Ownership Report
$20.00 R&T 480.3(b)

351 Notification of Involuntary Lien - (per debtor) $5.00 GC 27387

352 Filing of Maps (first page) $9.00 GC 27372

353 Each additional page $2.00 GC 27372

354 Preliminary 20-day Filing and Notice $25.00 GC 27361.9

355 Copy Fees

356 Official records and small maps

357 First page $2.50 GC 27366

358 Each additional page of same document $0.50 GC 27366

359 Official records from large books and ledgers

360 First page $3.50 GC 27366

361 Each additional page of same document $1.00 GC 27366

362 Large maps

363 First page $3.50 GC 27366

364 Each additional page of same map $0.80 GC 27366

365 Certified Copy of Birth $25.00 H&S 103625

366 Birth Certificate for Public Agency $19.00

367 Marriage Certificate $15.00

368 Marriage Certificate for Public Agency $11.00

369 Death Certificate for Public or Public Agency $21.00

370 Certification of photocopy, per document $1.00 GC 27364

371 Microfilm (per roll) $22.00 GC 54985

372 Microfilm 35mm (per roll) $23.00 GC 54985

373 CD of Official Records - Mailed Weekly $31.00

374 Pick-up Weekly $27.00

375 Mailed Daily $19.00

376 Pick-up Daily $15.00

377 Vital Records Search Fees

378 Birth $25.00 H&S 103650

379 Marriage $15.00 H&S 103650

380 Death $21.00 H&S 103650

381 General records (per year, per name) $5.00 GC 27369

DRAFT-REVISED JULY 12, 2021 4 Adopted by Resolution No. 21-XXX, Fees Effective as of August 15, 2021



Exhibit X

Line Fee Title Fee Amount Government Code Justification

County of Mendocino Master Fee Schedule

382 Miscellaneous Fees

383 Returned check charge $25.00 GC 6151.7(b)

384 Remote access fee (per month) $175.00

385 Clerk of the Board

386 (Shared fees exist in relation to planning-related items, please refer to Planning and Building Services)

387 Copy of CD recording of Board of Supervisor's meeting $15.00

388 Copy of DVD recording of Board of Supervisor's meeting $20.00

389 Board Audio Recording (USB Flash Drive) $10.00 GC 6256, 6257

390 Other

391
Assessment Appeals Board (AAB) Application for Changed Assessment 

Processing Fee
$55.00

392 Assessment Appeals Board Finding of Fact (See County Counsel) $0.00 Reso. No.'s 11-072, 13-065

393 Certification Fee (per certification) $2.00 GC 6256, 6257

394 Comparison of Pages (per page) $0.50

395 Recordings of Proceedings/Actual Cost $8.00

396 Facsimile within County

397 First page $1.00

398 Each additional page $0.50

399 Facsimile outside County

400 First page $2.00

401 Each additional page $0.50

402 Transcripts of Proceedings/each Actual Cost

403 Multiple Planning Appeals Fee of the most expensive appeal and one-half the fee of EACH additional fee

404 County Counsel

405

Special District Fees: Fees have not been increased since 2006. Legal 

Services fee for Special Districts, Boards and Commissions will be 

increased to $160/hour.

$160.00

406

Planning and Building Services and Department of Transportation: 

Charges for Minor Subdivision Reviews which include: Road Maintenance 

Agreements, Private Road Maintenance Agreements, Subdivision 

Improvement Agreements and Monumentation Agreements.  This will be 

a flat rate of $150.

$150.00

407

Planning and Building Services and Department of Transportation: 

Development Agreement Reviews will be charged at our billable rate of 

$160/hour.

$160.00

408

Conservatorship Fees: LPS and Probate Cases for reappointments and 

accountings.  See Exhibit A attached for the new rates.  Public Guardian 

cases that are extraordinary services will be charged 160/hour.

$160.00 Section 10811

409
Public Administrator Cases: $160/hour for extraordinary services beyond 

the statutory fees stated in Probate Code Section 10811.
$160.00 Section 10811

410 Release of Lis Pendens in Civil Litigation Cases $150.00

411
Fee for Written Findings of Fact: A minimum deposit of $250.00 would be 

required. Collection instructions: BOE -AH(S1) or any revision there of.
$131. 00 per hour Reso. No. 11-072

412 Court Collections

413 State Restitution Fine 10% Collection Fee varies PC 1202.4 WIC730.6(q), Reso. No. 11-072

414 Restitution collection 15% of court ordered restitution PC 1203.1

415 Installment payments fee $50.00 PC 1205(d)

416 DMV assessment-maintenance of record $10.00 VC 40508.6

417 Failure to Appear Fee $15.00 PC 853.7a, VC 40508.5

418 Cultural Service Agency

419 Library

420 Miscellaneous

421 Fines

422 Over due fines - Adult material $.25 per day/per item ($10 max)

423 Over due fines - Children's material $.10 per day/per item

424 Out of State Interlibrary Loan fee to other states $10.00 Reso No. 10-109

425 Interlibrary Loan to our customers $2.00 Reso No. 10-109

426 Records Center

427 Photocopy $.10 per page

428 Printing $.10 per page

429 Replacement Fees

430 Lost or Damaged Item Replacement Fee
Items under $100.00 = Item Replacement Cost

Items over $100.00 = Replacement Cost + $10.00 fee
431 Public Computer Use Fees

432 USB Flash Drives $5.00

433 Earbuds $3.00

434 Museum

435 Photocopies

436 Photocopies from published printed works

437 8.5"X11" $.10 per page

438 8.5"X14" $.25 per page

439 11"x17" $.50 per page
440 Photocopies from material in manuscript (unpublished) collections
441 8.5"X11"

442 8.5"X14" $.75 per page

443 11"x17" $1.00 Per page
444 Mail order photocopying (domestic) - postage and handling fees
445 1-15 photocopies $2.50

446 16-30 photocopies $4.00

447 31-50 photocopies $5.00
448 Mail order photocopying (Foreign Mail) - postage and handling fees
449 1-25 photocopies $10.00

450 26-50 photocopies $15.00

451 51-100 photocopies $20.00

452 Admission

453 Adult $4.00

454 Children and Students $1.00

455 Family $7.00

456 ROMP Members $3.00

457 Museum Classroom Day Use Fee (During Museum's Public Hours) $120.00 Reso. No. 19-170

458 Museum Classroom Hourly Use Fee (During Museum's Public Hours) $30.00 Reso. No. 19-170

459 Parks and Recreation

460 Low Gap Park - Amphitheater Day Use Fee $130.00 Reso. No. 19-170

461 Low Gap Park - Group Picnic Area Day Use Fee $130.00 Reso. No. 19-170

462 Mill Creek Park - Group Area Day Use Fee $130.00 Reso. No. 19-170

463 Bower Park - Outdoor Theater Day Use Fee $130.00 Reso. No. 19-170

464 Bower Park - Group Picnic Area Day Use Fee $130.00 Reso. No. 19-170

465 Indian Creek Day Use Parking $2.00

466 Indian Creek Park Campground (per night, per vehicle) $25.00

467 Redwood Valley Lion's Park - Group Picnic Area Day Use Fee $130.00 Reso. No. 19-170

468
Low Gap Park/Mill Creek Park - Vehicle Access Key Rental Fee       (48 

hour rental)
$20.00 Reso. No. 19-170

DRAFT-REVISED JULY 12, 2021 5 Adopted by Resolution No. 21-XXX, Fees Effective as of August 15, 2021



Exhibit X

Line Fee Title Fee Amount Government Code Justification

County of Mendocino Master Fee Schedule

469
Low Gap/Mill Creek Park - Vehicle Access Key Late Return Fee                
*Note: Fee is per day, up to a maximum 5 days

$10.00 per day ($50.00 max) Reso. No. 19-170

470 Park Day Use Rescheduling Fee $20.00 Reso. No. 19-170

471
Park Day Use Cancellation Fee                                                                                     
* Note: Partial refunds given at least 30 days prior to scheduled reservation date

$20.00 Reso. No. 19-170

472 Executive Office

473 General

474 Film Permits

475 Film Permit $150.00

476 Facilities

477 Veterans Hall Rental Fees

478 Public Use (Public or Private Functions) $500.00 per day Reso. No. 19-331

479 Congressional Chartered Groups and Auxiliaries Free Reso. No. 19-331

480 Historically Sponsored Groups Free Reso. No. 19-331

481 All County Departments and Agencies for Offical Functions Free Reso. No. 19-331

482 Non-Profit Veterans related groups $90.00 per day Reso. No. 19-331

483 Recognized Employee Groups $90.00 per day Reso. No. 19-331

484
Other Non-Profit Organizations and Governmental Agencies (Including 

but not Limited to; Schools, City, State, and Federal Agencies)
$350.00 per day Reso. No. 19-331

485 Cleaning Deposit $500.00 per rental Reso. No. 19-331

486 Key Deposit $20.00 Reso. No. 19-331

487 Information Services

488 Provision of GIS Data - Vector Data $30.00
Average of GIS Coordinator/GIS weighted rates; based on 

average time per instance

489 Provision of GIS Data - Raster Data $41.00
Average of GIS Coordinator/GIS weighted rates; based on 

average time per instance

490 GIS Services to Outside Agencies - Information Services Cost of Labor Hourly charge for services

491 Health and Human Services Agency

492 Community Health Services

493 Alcohol & Other Drugs

494 Outpatient Treatment Sliding scale based upon ability to pay H&S 11852.5

495 Diversion Education Program Sliding scale based upon ability to pay PC 1000, PC 1211

496 Assessment $74.79 H&S 11852.5

497 Men's Alternative to Violence (per month) $90.00 PC 1203.087, 1203.098

498 Emergency Medical Services

499
STEMI Receiving Center Authorization (60,000 divided by 4 centers/pro-

rated by volume)
$60,000.00

500 EMS Receiving Hospital Authorization $8,000.00

501 EMS Base Hospital Per Contract

502 Certification and Accreditation Fees

503
EMT (replaces EMT I) Initial Certification & Recertification EMS Agency 

Fee
$80.00 Reso. No. 03-138, Title 22 CCR 100083

504 Additional State Fee for EMT Initial Certification $75.00 Title 22 CCR 100083

505 Additional State Fee for EMT Recertification $37.00 Title 22 CCR 100083

506
EMT Advanced (replaces EMT II) Initial Certification & Recertification 

EMS Agency Fee
$80.00 Reso. No. 03-138, Title 22 CCR 100130

507 Additional State Fee for EMT Advance Certification $75.00 Title 22 CCR 100130

508 Additional State Fee for EMT Advance Recertification $37.00 Title 22 CCR 100083

509 Paramedic Accreditation (no recert fee applies) $200.00 Reso. No. 03-138, Title 22 CCR 100171 (1979.212)

510 First Responder Certification $80.00 Elective Certification

511
MICN (Mobile Intensive Care Nurses/Flight Nurses) Initial Accreditation 

& Recertification
$80.00 Reso. No. 03-138, H&S Code 1797.212

512 MICN (Mobile Intensive Care Nurses/Flight Nurses) Recertification $80.00 Reso. No. 03-138, H&S Code1  797.212

513 Level III Trauma Center Designation $50,000.00 Reso. No. 14-047

514 Level IV Trauma Center Designation $20,000.00 Reso. No. 14-047

515 Replacement Card $20.00 Reso No. 03-138, H&S Code 1797.212

516 Per Call Fees - Hospitals

517 Emergency Patients Received $0.00 Reso. No. 14-047

518 Per Call Fees - Ambulances

519 Emergency Patients Transported $4.75 Reso. No. 03-138, Title 22 CCR 100083

520 Emergency Patients Transferred to/or Received $2.37 Reso. No. 03-138, Title 22 CCR 100083

521 Ambulance Permit Fees

522 Initial Permit & Inspection (Initial One-Time Fee) $900.00 Reso. No. 03-138, Title 22 CCR 100083

523 Plus Initial Permit Fee (Per Ambulance) $200.00 Reso. No. 03-138, Title 22 CCR 100083

524 Annual Renewal Fee $136.00 Reso. No. 03-138, Title 22 CCR 100083

525 Plus Initial Permit Fee (Per Ambulance) $200.00 Reso. No. 03-138, Title 22 CCR 100083

526 OES/Dispatch Fees Collected

527
Dispatch Fees (total of annual fees that are collected by EMS from 

participating service providers)
$118,959.00 Title 22 CCR 100083

528 Environmental Health

529 Body Art Program Fees

530 Body Art Facility $125.00 Reso. No. 12-088, H&S 101325, 119324.5

531 Practitioner Registration $42.00 Reso. No. 12-088, H&S 101325, 119324.5

532 Mobile Body Art Facility $63.00 Reso. No. 12-088, H&S 101325, 119324.5

533 Temporary Body Art Facility $63.00 Reso. No. 12-088, H&S 101325, 119324.5

534 Plan Review, Major $250.00 Reso. No. 12-088, H&S 101325, 119324.5

535 Plan Review, Minor $125.00 Reso. No. 12-088, H&S 101325, 119324.5

536

537 Annual Cannabis Review $182.00 Reso. No. 19-170

538 Amended Renewal Application Review $281.00 Reso. No. 19-170

539 Cannabis Facility Business License Review (EHHAZ) $155.00 Reso. No. 19-170

540 Initial Cannabis Review $343.00 Reso. No. 19-170

541

542 Class A Registration $64.00 Reso. No. 13-042, H&S 101325, 113713

543 Class B Permit $182.00 Reso. No. 13-042, H&S 101325, 113715

544 Food Establishment Fees

545 Restaurant & Bar over 650 square feet $769.00 H&S 101325, 113713

546 Restaurant & Bar under 650 square feet $517.00 H&S 101325, 113713

547 Restaurant over 650 square feet (including large school kitchens) $690.00 H&S 101325, 113713

548 Restaurant under 650 square feet (including medium school kitchens) $443.00 H&S 101325, 113713

549 Bed & Breakfast $320.00 H&S 101325, 113713

550 Continental Breakfast Only $250.00 H&S 101325, 113713

551 Bars $422.00 H&S 101325, 113713

552 Seasonal Restaurant (6 months or less) $375.00 H&S 101325, 113713

553 Mobile Food Preparation Unit $544.00 H&S 101325, 113713

554 Temporary Food Facility

555 Temporary Hazardous Food Booth (submitted 5 days prior to the event) $64.00 H&S 101325, 113713

Cannabis Fee

Cottage Food Fees

DRAFT-REVISED JULY 12, 2021 6 Adopted by Resolution No. 21-XXX, Fees Effective as of August 15, 2021



Exhibit X

Line Fee Title Fee Amount Government Code Justification

County of Mendocino Master Fee Schedule

556 Temporary Hazardous Food Booth (submitted the day of the event) $113.00 H&S 101325, 113713

557 Three or more events per year $163.00 H&S 101325, 113713

558 Temporary Non-Hazardous Food Facility

559
Temporary Non-Hazardous Food Booth (submitted 5 days prior to the 

event)
$47.00 H&S 101325, 113713

560 Temporary Non-Hazardous Food Booth (submitted the day of the event) $84.00 H&S 101325, 113713

561 Three or more events per year $91.00 H&S 101325, 113713

562 Catering Kitchen (not covered in other fee category) $307.00 H&S 101325, 113713

563 Catering in a Permitted Facility $277.00 H&S 101325, 113713

564 Bakery $415.00 H&S 101325, 113713

565 Bakery with Units (Deli / Restaurant / etc.) $715.00 H&S 101325, 113713

566 Large Retail Market (over 10,000 square feet) $651.00 H&S 101325, 113713

567 Large Retail Market (over 10,000 square feet) with units $1,501.00 H&S 101325, 113713

568
Medium Retail Market (over 2,000 square feet but under 10,000 square 

feet)
$527.00 H&S 101325, 113713

569
Medium Retail Market (over 2,000 square feet but under 10,000 square 

feet) with units
$663.00 H&S 101325, 113713

570 Small Retail Market (under 2,000 square feet including units) $336.00 H&S 101325, 113713

571 Mobile Food Facility (Vehicles) $228.00 H&S 101325, 113713

572 Farmers Market $0.00 Reso. No. 19-373, H&S 101325, 113713

573 Produce Stand/Produce Truck $50.00 Reso. No. 13-042, H&S 101325, 113713

574 Low Risk Minimal Food (includes small school kitchens) $228.00 H&S 101325, 113713

575 Plan Review, Major $883.00 H&S 101325, 113713

576 Plan Review, Minor $398.00 H&S 101325, 113713

577 Vending Machines, per year (9.08.150 MCC):

578 1-10 Machines $87.00 H&S 101325, 113713

579 11 or more Machines $175.00 H&S 101325, 113713

580 Organized Camps $376.00 H&S 101325, 113713

581 Community Event Application (less than 15 vendors) $158.00 H&S 101325, 113713

582 Community Event Late Application (less than 15 vendors) $256.00 H&S 101325, 113713

583 Community Event Application (15 or more vendors) $303.00 H&S 101325, 113713

584 Community Event Late Application (15 or more vendors) $384.00 H&S 101325, 113713

585 Food Handler Certification Class with book $152.00 H&S 101325, 113713

586 Food Handler Certification (exam only) $78.00 H&S 101325, 113713

587 Food Handler Certification Class Only $105.00 H&S 101325, 113713

588 Additional fee for Private On-site Water System $135.00 H&S 101325, 113713

589 Water Program Fees

590 State Small Water System Operational Permit $590.00 H&S 64253, 64259

591 Solid Waste Fees

592 Applications

593 Permit Modification $2,689.00 H&S 101025, 101325P,  RC 43202, 43213

594 Permit Revision $3,437.00 H&S 101025, 101325P,  RC 43202, 43213

595 Periodic Site Review $1,208.00 H&S 101025, 101325P,  RC 43202, 43213

596 Exemption from a Solid Waste Facility Permit $1,086.00 H&S 101025, 101325P,  RC 43202, 43213

597 Closure / Post-Closure Plans $6,722.00 H&S 101025, 101325P,  RC 43202, 43213

598 Hearing Panel Appeal $522.00 H&S 101025, 101325P,  RC 43202, 43213

599 New Solid waste Facility (fee per hour) $126.49 H&S 101025, 101325P,  RC 43202, 43213

600 Annual Inspection Fees

601 Full Solid Waste Facility Permit:

602 Woodwaste Disposal Site $5,912.00 H&S 101025, 101325, PRC 43202, 43213

603 Composting Facility Site $6,390.00 H&S 101025, 101325, PRC 43202, 43213

604 Large Volume Transfer Station or Material Recovery Facility $6,959.00 H&S 101025, 101325, PRC 43202, 43213

605 Enforcement Agency Notification:

606 Limited Volume Transfer Station up to 60 yd3 $1,117.00 H&S 101025, 101325, PRC 43202, 43213

607 Sealed Container Transfer Station $464.00 H&S 101025, 101325, PRC 43202, 43213

608 Agricultural Material Compost $852.00 H&S 101025, 101325, PRC 43202, 43213

609 Construction and Demolition Facility $1,117.00 H&S 101025, 101325, PRC 43202, 43213

610 Grinding and Chipping Facility $1,117.00 H&S 101025, 101325, PRC 43202, 43213

611 Registration Permit:

612 Compost Facility Site $2,132.00 H&S 101025, 101325, PRC 43202, 43213

613 Medium Volume Transfer Station $3,288.00 H&S 101025, 101325, PRC 43202, 43213

614 Closed, Abandoned, Unpermitted, or Exempt Site - Annual Inspections $540.00 H&S 101025, 101325, PRC 43202, 43213

615 Closed, Abandoned, Unpermitted, or Exempt Site - Quarterly Inspections $1,780.00 H&S 101025, 101325, PRC 43202, 43213

616 Closed Municipal Solid Waste Landfill with Gas Monitoring $5,474.00 H&S 101025, 101325, PRC 43202, 43213

617 Pool and Spa Fees

618 Public Swimming Pool/Spa, seasonal fee (6 months) $270.00 H&S 101325, 116053

619 Public Swimming Pool/Spa, annual fee $444.00 H&S 101325, 116053

620 Plan Review, Major $894.00 H&S 101325, 116053

621 Plan Review, Minor $261.00 H&S 101325, 116053

622 Domestic Water Fees

623 Water Sample-collection and bacteriological testing (9.16.010 MCC) $123.00 H&S 101025, 101325, 116270 & Water Code 13803

624 Water Well Permits (9.16.010 MCC) $361.00 H&S 101025, 101325, 116270 & Water Code 13803

625 Water Well Permit - Relocation Review $61.00 H&S 101025, 101325, 116270 & Water Code 13803

626 Water Well Permit - Special Areas $396.00 H&S 101025, 101325, 116270 & Water Code 13803

627 Water Well Destruction Permit $182.00 H&S 101025, 101325, 116270 & Water Code 13803

628 Water Well Repair Permit $134.00 H&S 101025, 101325, 116270 & Water Code 13803

629 Water Well Pump Test Review $89.00 H&S 101025, 101325, 116270 & Water Code 13803

630 Water Well Permit Renewals (per year) $56.00 H&S 101025, 101325, 116270 & Water Code 13803

631 Water Well Reinspections (after two inspections) $246.00 H&S 101025, 101325, 116270 & Water Code 13803

632 Liquid Waste Fees

633 Site Evaluation Report Review - Standard System - New $490.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

634 Site Evaluation Report Review - Standard System - Replacement $325.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

635 Site Evaluation Report Review - Non-Standard System - New $690.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

636
Site Evaluation Report Review - Additional charge for systems over 600 

gal/day, per 100 gal/day over 600 gal/day, increase fee by
$12.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

637 Site Evaluation Report Review - Non-Standard System - Replacement $354.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

638 Site Evaluation Report Review - Revision $168.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

639 Site Evaluation Report Review - Non-Standard System Revision $296.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

640 Site Evaluation Report Review - Archival Review greater than 5 years $76.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

641 Site Evaluation Report Review - Waiver Request $120.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

642 Site Evaluation Report Review - Formal Appeal $362.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

643 Site Evaluation Report Review - Sewage Pump (Std Add-On) $80.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

644 Site Evaluation Report Review - Groundwater Drain $68.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

645
Site Evaluation Report Review - Discovery Report of Existing Unknown 

System
$161.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

646 DEH Sewage System Failure Analysis $148.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

647 Standard Sewage System Permit - New $553.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

648 Standard Sewage System Permit - Repair, Expansion or Replacement $345.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325, Reso. No. 13-042

649 Non-Standard Sewage System Permit - New or Replacement $858.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

DRAFT-REVISED JULY 12, 2021 7 Adopted by Resolution No. 21-XXX, Fees Effective as of August 15, 2021



Exhibit X

Line Fee Title Fee Amount Government Code Justification

County of Mendocino Master Fee Schedule

650 Non-Standard Sewage System Permit - Repair $493.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325, Reso. No. 11-074

651 Non-Standard Sewage System Operational Permit $150.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

652 Sewage System Permit Renewal $111.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

653 Sewage System Permit Renewal, Late Penalty $133.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

654 Septic Tank Installation/Destruction Permit $306.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325, Reso. No. 13-042

655 Request for exception of Mendocino County Code $229.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

656 Request for Soil Moisture Construction Inspection $146.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

657 Request for Comment to DRE Public Report $218.00 H&S 17922, 17950, 17951, 101025, 101325

658 Septic Tank Pumpers, per year (9.23.070 MCC) $344.00 H&S 101025, 1011325, 117405

659 Land Use Fees

660 Land Division, On-site Sewage and Water $630.00 Gov Code 65100, 65300, H&S 101325

661 + Fee per Unimproved Lot $83.00 Gov Code 65100, 65300, H&S 101325

662 Land Division, On-site Sewage and Public Water Supply $584.00 Gov Code 65100, 65300, H&S 101325

663 Land Division, Public Sewer System and On-site Water $882.00 Gov Code 65100, 65300, H&S 101325

664 + Fee per Unimproved Lot $83.00 Gov Code 65100, 65300, H&S 101325

665 Land Division, Public Sewer and Public Water Supply $411.00 Gov Code 65100, 65300, H&S 101325

666 Modification of Conditions $96.00 Gov Code 65100, 65300, H&S 101325

667 Boundary Line Adjustment $245.00 Gov Code 65100, 65300, H&S 101325, Reso. No. 11-074

668 Use Permit $300.00 Gov Code 65100, 65300, H&S 101325, Reso. No. 11-074

669 Use Permit Renewal $253.49 Gov Code 65100, 65300, H&S 101325

670 General Plan Amendment $79.00 Gov Code 65100, 65300, H&S 101325

671 Coastal Development Permit Application Review $280.00 Gov Code 65100, 65300, H&S 101325, Reso. No. 11-074

672 Building Permit Application Review $135.00 Gov Code 65100, 65300, H&S 101325

673 Use Permit Modification Application review $278.25 Gov Code 65100, 65300, H&S 101325

674 Administrative Permit Application Review $92.97 Gov Code 65100, 65300, H&S 101325

675 Environmental Impact Report Review $370.00 Gov Code 65100, 65300, H&S 101325

676 Pre-Application Conference $224.19 Gov Code 65100, 65300, H&S 101325

677 General Environmental Health Fees

678 Transfer of Ownership/Registration $128.00 Reso No. 12-088, H&S 101025, 101325

679

Environmental Health Consultations, Inspections, Enforcement, Report 

Reviews, Meetings, or other services not covered by the initial fee (per 

hour)

$128.00 Reso No. 12-088, H&S 101025, 101325

680
Mobile Home Parks - Plan Review, Clearance, and Inspection of Sewage 

Disposal Systems, Water Systems, and Swimming Pools (per hour)
$128.00 Reso No. 12-088, H&S 101025, 101325

681
Delinquent Payment Fee (assessed monthly; based on original fee) *Fee 
Corrected due to typographical error (June 15, 2010 - KK)

20% H&S 101025, 101325

682 Violation Reinspection Fee $103.00 H&S 101025, 101325

683 Penalties

684
(a) Beginning construction on a Food Facility or Spa/Pool without a Plan 

Check Clearance,
100% of original fee H&S 101025, 101325

685 (b) Operating a Food Facility with a valid Permit to Operate 100% of original fee

686

(c) Beginning construction on a Septic Tank, Well or Underground 

Storage Tank (UST) including associated piping without obtaining a 

permit

100% of original fee

687 (d) Removing a UST without obtaining a Tank Abandonment Clearance 100% of original fee

688 (e) Operating a UST without a permit 100% of original fee

689 Division of Environmental Health Hourly Rate $128.00 Reso No. 12-088, Gov Code 65100, 65300, H&S 101325

690
Appeal of Code Enforcement Notice and Order to Abate (Nuisance 

Abatement Ordinance Enforcement Appeals Fee)
$1,197.00 MCC Chpt 8.75

691 Appeal of Administrative Permit Decision $1,197.00 Reso No. 12-088, H&S 101025, 101325

692 Hazardous Materials Fees

693 Administrative Services

694 Hazmat Spill Response (per hour) one person $204.00 H&S 25507.2, 101025, 101325

695 Hazmat Spill Response (per hour) two people required $270.00 H&S 25507.2, 101025, 101325

696 Unified Program - State Surcharges

697 Facility (per location) $49.00 H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 15210

698 Underground Storage Tank (per tank) $15.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210
699 CalARP $370.00 H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 15210

700 Annual Permit Fees

701 Underground Storage Tanks

702
Type 1 Permit

(Total gallons of all tanks 5,000 gallons or less)

703 First Tank, each site $328.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210

704 Each Additional Tank, same site $179.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210

705
Type 2 Permit

(Total gallons of all tanks greater than 5,000 gallons)

706 First Tank, each site $627.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210

707 Each Additional Tank, same site $293.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210
708 Construction Permit Fees

709 New Construction

710 First Tank 2,041.00$ 
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210

711 Each Additional Tank, same site $565.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210
712 Recertification Inspection for Tank Structure and Lining

713 First Tank $500.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210

714 Each Additional Tank, same site $214.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210

715
Secondary Containment Testing

(6 month test after new installation)

716 System Modification $258.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210

717 System Repair (per hour) $128.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210, Reso No. 12-088

718 Monitoring System Upgrade

719 First Tank $477.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210

720 Each Additional Tank, same site $156.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210
721 Corrosion (Cathodic) Protection System, each submission

722 First Tank $504.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210

723 Each Additional Tank, same site $143.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210
724 Tank Closure

725 First Tank $485.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210

726 Each Additional Tank, same site $210.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210

DRAFT-REVISED JULY 12, 2021 8 Adopted by Resolution No. 21-XXX, Fees Effective as of August 15, 2021



Exhibit X

Line Fee Title Fee Amount Government Code Justification

County of Mendocino Master Fee Schedule

727 Monitoring Well and Boring Fees

728 Monitory Well Construction - First Well $360.00 H&S 101025, 101325, 116270, Water Code 13803

729
Monitory Well Construction - Each additional well/same site and 

inspection
$24.00 H&S 101025, 101325, 116270, Water Code 13803

730 Monitoring Well Destruction Permit

731 Monitory Well Destruction - First Well $402.00 H&S 101025, 101325, 116270, Water Code 13803

732
Monitory Well Destruction - Each additional well/same site and 

inspection
$67.00 H&S 101025, 101325, 116270, Water Code 13803

733 Borings

734 Borings - First Well $96.00 H&S 101025, 101325, 116270, Water Code 13803

735 Borings - Each additional boring/same site and inspection $33.00 H&S 101025, 101325, 116270, Water Code 13803

736 * To qualify for this reduced plan fee, aboveground storage must be less than or equal to 110 gallons, 2000 cubic feet, or 1000 pounds of hazardous substance
737 * Facilities with Extremely Hazardous Substances do not qualify for this reduced fee.
738 Hazardous Materials Management Plan and CalARP Facility Categories:

739
HMBP Exemption Request

Cat.  Liquids(gal.)    Solids(lbs.)      Gasses(cu.ft.)

740 0              Limited Business Plan Reporting $249.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210

741 1        55-110                 500-1,000                  200-2,000 $511.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210

742 2       111-500               1,001-5000               2,001-10,000 $647.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210

743 3      501-1,000            5,000-10,000            10,001-30,000 $851.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210

744 4     1,001-5,000          10,001-100,000          30,001-50,000 $987.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210

745 5    5,001-20,000      100,001-200,000        50,001-2,000,000 $1,122.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210

746 6   20,001-150,000    200,001-300,000     2,000,000-3,000,000 $1,422.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210

747 7       150,001+               300,001+                3,000,001+ $1,694.00
H&S 25404(a)(1)(A), 25287(a) & (b), 101025, 101325, 27 CCR 

15210
748 APSA Tier 3 Facility $272.00 H&S 101325, 25404(a)(1)(A), 27 CCR 15211 

749 APSA non-Tier 3 Facility $136.00 H&S 101325, 25404(a)(1)(A), 27 CCR 15210 

750

751

752 Mental Health Services (MHS) $2.61 per minute Reso. No. 19-170

753 Linkage Case Management Services (CM) $2.20 per minute Reso. No. 19-170

754 Medication Support Services $5.40 per minute Reso. No. 19-170

755 Crisis Services $3.88 per minute Reso. No. 19-170
756

757 Enteric Culture, Primary $19.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

758 Enteric Serotyping $19.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

759 TPPA (Treponeme) $31.50 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

760 Gonorrhea - NAAT $49.50 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

761 Gonorrhea Culture, Primary $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

762 Mycology:

763 Culture, Primary $11.50 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

764 Fungus ID, each $20.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

765 Yeast ID, each $18.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

766 Definitive CI, Dermatophytes $30.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

767 Parasite (intestinal):

768 Formalin-Ether Concentrate Smear $9.50 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

769 Direct Smear-Crypto, Giardia $9.50 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

770 Trichome Stained Smear $13.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

771 Pinworm $21.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

772 Routine Bacterial Culture or CI $21.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

773 Tuberculosis:

774 Culture, "Migit 960" / Solid Media $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

775 Sputum Concentration $10.50 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

776 AFB Smear Only $10.50 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

777 TB Panel, Culture, ID & Sensitivity $97.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

778 Sensitivities - 3 drug $63.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

779 Sensitivity - PZA $46.50 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

780 Nucleuc Acid Probe, each $59.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

781 VDRL, Syphylis Serology $8.50 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

782 Lyme Disease, Serology Elisa IgM / IgG $40.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

783 Lyme Disease, Western Blot IgM / IgG $71.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

784 Ehrlichia chafeensis Serology $40.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

785 Ehrlichia H.G.E. Serology $40.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

786 Babesia WA-1 Serology or Microti-serol $45.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

787 Tick for Lyme Disease Serol DFA $29.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

788 Ticks (bulk testing per 100 ticks) $840.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

789 Food Cultures (per suspect pathogen) $79.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

790 Streptococcal Culture and Grouping $10.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

791 Pertussis Culture $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

792 AIDS Test:

793 HIV Elisa $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

794 HIV Western Blot or IFA $63.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

795 Chlamydia NAAT $49.50 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

796 Direct or Indirect FA or Darkfield $19.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

797 Hepatitis C (antibody only) $21.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

798 Herpes Isolation and Typing $42.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

799 Rabies (Large Animals: Cow, Horse, etc.) $135.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

800
Rabies (Small Animals: Opossum, Skunk, etc.), a separate decapitation 

and/or decerebration fee may apply
$90.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

801 Virus Culture Non Herpes:

802 Flu and Other Respiratory Viruses $34.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

803 Viral Testing (SF-PHL) Additional Studies, e.g. FA $31.50 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

804 Handling Fee $5.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

805 Viral Load (HIV) $125.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

806 West Nile Virus Serology Screening $36.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

807 R-Mix Respiratory Virus x 7 $238.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

808 T Cell Count (3 cell marker) $73.11 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

809 Water Fecal Coliforms $22.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

810 Shellfish, Oyster Meat $60.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

811 Shellfish, Oyster Meat $60.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

812 Salt Water, MPH 15 tubes: E Coli $49.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

813 Quantitray-Colilert-Enterolert $36.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

814 Real Time PCR

815 Chain Reactions Tests for:

816 Bordetella Pertussis $59.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

817 Mycobacteria Tuberculosis $59.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

818 Influenza $59.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

819 Norovirus $59.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

820 Handling Fee $5.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

821 Any test Not listed on this schedule $2.00 per procedure time value unit (PTV) Title 9, Section 9.16.010

822 Nursing

823 Immunizations - Routine Childhood:

Public Health Laboratory (All tests are free if initiated by the Public Health Department or if a Public Health need is indicated)

Mental Health

Behavior Health and Recovery Services

DRAFT-REVISED JULY 12, 2021 9 Adopted by Resolution No. 21-XXX, Fees Effective as of August 15, 2021



Exhibit X

Line Fee Title Fee Amount Government Code Justification

County of Mendocino Master Fee Schedule

824 Dap (Diphtheria, Pertussis and Tetanus) $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

825 MMR (Measles, Mumps, Rubella) $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

826 Td $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

827 Polio $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

828 HIB $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

829 Varicella $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

830 Hep B $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

831 Hep A $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

832 Pediatric Diphtheria/Tetanus $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

833 Pneumococcal Conjug $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

834 Flu $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

835 HPV $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

836 Tdap $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

837 MMRV $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

838 Rotavirus $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

839 Meningococcal (Conjugate) $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

840 Immunizations - Adult / Other:
841 Hep A $70.35 Title 9, Section 9.16.010, Reso. No. 19-373
842 Hep B $60.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010, Reso. No. 14-047

843 Twinrix (Hep. A and B Combined Vaccine) $81.90 Title 9, Section 9.16.010, Reso. No. 19-373

844 Pyrazinamide (TB Medication) $132.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010, Reso. No. 19-373

845 Flu/Pneumonia $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010, Reso. No. 14-047

846 Varicella $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

847 Td $28.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

848 MMR (Measles, Mumps, Rubella) $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

849 INH $14.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010, Reso. No. 14-047

850 Vitamin B6 (In conjunction with INH) $7.50 Title 9, Section 9.16.010, Reso. No. 14-047

851 Rabies (Pre-exposure) cost + office visit/admin fee Title 9, Section 9.16.010

852 Rabies (Post-exposure) cost + office visit/admin fee Title 9, Section 9.16.010

853 Tdap $50.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010, Reso. No. 14-047

854 Communicable Disease Contacts (fee per person):

855 PPD adult certified $20.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010, Reso. No. 14-047

856 PPD child certified $20.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010, Reso. No. 14-047

857 PPD case contacts $10.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

858 IG/Measles contact $10.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

859 IG/Hepatitis $10.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

860 Miscellaneous:

861 Nurse Drop-In Visits $10.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

862 Office Consultation (Cardiology Clinic) $135.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

863 Federally Approved Sliding-Scale Rates Varied Title 9, Section 9.16.010

864 Home Visit (TCM) Set by Medi-Cal Title 9, Section 9.16.010

865

866 New Patient - Problem Focused/10 minutes $50.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

867 New Patient - Expanded Problem/20 minutes $100.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

868 New Patient - Detailed/30 minutes $150.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

869 New Patient - Comprehensive/45 minutes $228.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

870 New Patient - Comprehensive/60 minutes $300.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

871 Established Patient - Eval & Mgt (No M.D.) $30.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

872 Established Patient - Problem Focused 10 minutes $40.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

873 Established Patient - Expanded/15 minutes $85.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

874 Established Patient - Detailed/25 minutes $100.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

875 Established Patient - Comprehensive/40 minutes $160.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

876 Team Conference/30 minutes $20.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

877 Team Conference/60 minutes $40.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

878 Sputum Induction $15.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

879 Venipuncture $10.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

880 CXR Interpretation $39.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

881 Hematocrit (Hct.) $3.50 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

882 Denver Developmental $50.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010

883 Medical Marijuana Identification Cards (MMIC)

884 Application Fee (non Medi-Cal client) $180.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010, H&S 11362.755(a)

885 Application Fee (primary caregiver, non Medi-Cal) $180.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010, H&S 11362.755(a)

886 Application Fee (client with Medi-Cal) $90.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010, H&S 11362.755(a)

887 Application Fee (primary caregiver with Medi-Cal) $90.00 Title 9, Section 9.16.010, H&S 11362.755(a)

888 Full fee MMIC $66.00 paid to State- Included Title 9, Section 9.16.010

889 Medi-Cal MMIC $33.00 paid to State - Included Title 9, Section 9.16.010

890 Tobacco Control Program

891 Tobacco Retailer Licensing Fee $290.00 Ord. No. 4203, County Code Ch 6.20

892 Planning & Building Services (PBS)
893 Building Division
894 BUILDING PERMIT FEES
895 Total Valuation (Occupancy Type Valuation X Total Sq. Ft. Valuation)

896 $1 to $500.00 $18.21 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No.  08-130

897 $501.00 to $2000.00
$18.21 for the first $500.00 plus $3.38 for each additional 

$100.00 or fraction thereof, to and including $2,000.00
Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

898 $2001.00 to $25000.00 

$54.62 for the first $2,000.00 plus $10.92 for each 

additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof, to and including 

$25,000.00

Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

899 $25001.00 to $50000.00

$305.87 for the first $25,000.00 plus $7.89 for each 

additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof, to and including 

$50,000.00

Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

900 $50001.00 to $100000.00

$503.10 for the first $50,000.00 plus $5.46 for each 

additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof, to and including 

$100,000.00

Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

901 $100001.00 to $500000.00

$776.20 for the first $100,000.00 plus $4.25 for each 

additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof, to and including 

$500,000.00

Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

902 $500001.00 to $1000000.00

$2,475.45 for the first $500,000.00 plus $3.64 for each 

additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof, to and including 

$1,000,000.00

Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

903 $1000001.00 and up
$4,296.09 for the first $1,000,000.00 plus $2.43 for each 

additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof
Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

904 ** Planning and Building Services Building Valuation Tables can be found in separate table on the last page of this schedule
905 ELECTRICAL PERMIT FEES

906 Issuance of Electrical Permit $164.00 
Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No.'s 08-130, 

18-122
907 System Fees:

908 Private Swimming Pools $60.08 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

909 Carnivals and Circuses:

910 Generators and Rides $28.52 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

911 Displays with Electric Lighting $8.80 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

912 System Area or Booth Lighting $8.80 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

913 Temporary Power Service:

914 Service Pole of Pedestal $28.52 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

915 Distribution System - Temporary $14.92 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

916 Unit Fees:

917 Receptacle, Switch and Light Outlets:

Rate shall be set by Medi-Cal through an annual State Required cost report.

Rate shall be adjusted with each annual cost report, and subject to sliding scale pertinent to TCM only.

DRAFT-REVISED JULY 12, 2021 10 Adopted by Resolution No. 21-XXX, Fees Effective as of August 15, 2021



Exhibit X

Line Fee Title Fee Amount Government Code Justification

County of Mendocino Master Fee Schedule

918 First 20 Fixtures $1.33 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

919 Additional Fixtures $0.88 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

920 Lighting Fixtures:

921 First 20 Fixtures $1.33 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

922 Additional Fixtures $0.88 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

923 For pole or platform-mounted lighting fixtures, each $1.33 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

924 For theatrical-type lighting fixtures or assemblies, each $1.33 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

925 Residential Appliances:

926 Fixed Residential $5.77 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

927 Non-Residential Appliances:

928 Non-Residential $5.77 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

929 Power Apparatus:

930 Up to and Including 1 $5.77 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

931 Over 1, 10 and Under each $14.92 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

932 Over 10, 50 and Under each $29.85 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

933 Over 50, 100 and Under each $60.08 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

934 Over 100, each $90.42 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

935 Signs, Outline Lighting, Marquees:

936 Single Branch Circuit $29.85 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

937 Each Additional $5.77 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

938 Services (each):

939 Services ≤ 600 volts and not ≤ 200 amperes in rating $37.02 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

940 Services ≤ 600 volts and 200 amperes to 1,000 amperes $75.40 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

941 Services over 600 volts or over 1,000 amperes in rating $150.87 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

942 Miscellaneous Apparatus, Conduits and Conductors:

943 Miscellaneous $22.09 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130
944 MECHANICAL PERMIT FEES

945 Issuance of Each Mechanical Permit $164.00 
Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No.'s 08-130, 

18-122
946 Unit Fees

947 Furnaces:

948 Up to and Including 100,000 Btu/h (29.3 kW) $17.96 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

949 Up to and Including 100,000 Btu/h (29.3 kW) $22.09 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

950 For the installation or relocation of each floor furnace, including vent $17.96 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

951
For the installation or relocation of each suspended heater, recessed wall 

heater or floor-mounted unit heater
$17.96 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

952 Appliance Vents $8.80 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

953 Repairs or Additions $16.62 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

954 Boilers, Compressors, Absorption Units:

955

For the installation or relocation of each boiler or compressor to and 

including 3 horsepower (10.6 kW), or each absorption system to and 

including 100,000 Btu/h (29.3 kW)

$17.84 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

956

For the installation or relocation of each boiler or compressor over 3 

horsepower (10.6 kW) to and including 15 horsepower (52.7 kW), or each 

absorption system over 100,000 Btu/h (29.3 kW) to and including 500,000 

Btu/h (146.6 kW)

$32.95 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

957

For the installation or relocation of each boiler or compressor over 15 

horsepower (52.7 kW) to and including 30 horsepower (105.5 kW), or 

each absorption system over 500,000 Btu/h (146.6 kW) to and including 

1,000,000 Btu/h (293.1 kW)

$45.21 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

958

For the installation or relocation of each boiler or compressor rated from 

30 horsepower (105.5 kW) and 50 horsepower (176 kW), or each 

absorption system over 1,000,000 Btu/h (293.1 kW) to and including 

1,750,000 Btu/h (512.9 kW)

$67.30 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

959

For the installation or relocation of each boiler or compressor over 50 

horsepower (176 kW), or each absorption system over 1,750,000 Btu/h 

(512.9 kW)

$112.46 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

960 Air Handlers:

961
For each air-handling unit to and including 10,000 cubic feet per minute 

(cfm) (4719 L/s), including ducts attached thereto
$12.39 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

962 For each air-handling unit over 10,000 cfm (4719 L/s) $21.96 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

963 Evaporator Coolers:

964 For each evaporative cooler other than portable type $12.93 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

965 Ventilation and Exhaust:

966 For each ventilation fan connected to a single duct $8.80 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

967
For each ventilation system which is not a portion of any heating or air-

conditioning system authorized by permit
$12.93 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

968
For the installation of each hood which is served by mechanical exhaust, 

including the ducts for such hood
$12.93 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

969 Incinerators:

970 Installation/relocation of each domestic-type incinerator $22.09 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

971 Install/relocation of each commercial/industrial incinerator $17.59 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

972 Incinerators:

973

For each appliance or piece of equipment regulated by the Mechanical 

Code but not classed in other appliance categories, or for which the fee is 

listed in the table

$12.93 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

974 PLUMBING PERMIT FEES

975 Issuance of Each Plumbing Permit $164.00 
Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No.'s 08-130, 

18-122
976 Unit Fees

977 Fixtures and Vents:

978
For each plumbing fixture or trap or set of fixtures on one trap (including 

water, drainage piping and backflow protection thereof)
$11.89 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

979 For repair or alteration of drainage or vent piping, each $5.80 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

980 Interceptors:

981

For each industrial waste pretreatment interceptor, including its trap and 

vent, excepting kitchen-type grease interceptors functioning as fixture 

traps

$29.92 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

982 Rainwater systems—per drain (inside building) $11.89 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

983 Water Piping and Water Heaters:

984
For installation, alteration, or repair of water piping or water-treating 

equipment, or both, each
$5.80 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

985 For each water heater including vent $14.92 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

986 Gas Piping Systems:

987 For each gas piping system of one to five outlets $7.47 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

988 For each additional outlet over five, each $1.33 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

989 Lawn Sprinklers, Vacuum Breakers and Backflow Protection Devices:

990
For each lawn sprinkler system on any one meter, including backflow 

protection devices thereof
$17.96 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

991 For atmospheric-type vacuum breakers or backflow protection devices not included in Item 1:

992 1 to 5 devices $13.81 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

993 Over 5 devices, each $2.73 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

994 For each backflow-protection device other than atmospheric-type vacuum breakers:

995 2 inches (50.8 mm) and smaller $13.81 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

996 Over 2 inches (50.8 mm) $29.92 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

997 Swimming Pools:

998 Public Pool $110.76 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

DRAFT-REVISED JULY 12, 2021 11 Adopted by Resolution No. 21-XXX, Fees Effective as of August 15, 2021



Exhibit X

Line Fee Title Fee Amount Government Code Justification

County of Mendocino Master Fee Schedule

999 Public Spa $73.74 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1000 Private Pool $73.74 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1001 Private Spa $36.72 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1002 ELEVATOR PERMIT FEES
1003 New Installations

1004 Passenger or freight elevator, escalator, moving walk:

1005 Up to and including $40,000.00 of valuation $108.02 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1006 Over $40,000.00 of valuation
$108.02 plus $2.01 for each $1,000.00 or fraction thereof 

over $40,000.00
Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1007 Dumbwaiter or private residence elevator:

1008 Up to and including $10,000 of valuation $30.34 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1009 Over $10,000.00 of valuation
$30.34 plus $2.01 for each $1,000.00 or fraction thereof 

over $10,000.00
Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1010 Elevator Annual Certificates of Inspection Fees

1011 For each elevator $50.37 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1012 For each escalator or moving walk $29.92 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1013 For each commercial dumbwaiter $20.33 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130
1014 BUILDING PLAN REVIEW FEES

1015 Plan Review Fee When the County Administers the Uniform Fire Code 100% of the Building Permit Fee Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1016 Plan Review Fee 75% of the Building Permit Fee Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1017 Plan Review Fee When the County Administers the Uniform Fire Code 100% of the Mechanical Permit Fee Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1018 Plan Review Fee 75% of the Mechanical Permit Fee Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1019 Plan Review Fee When the County Administers the Uniform Fire Code 100% of the Plumbing Permit Fee Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1020 Plan Review Fee 75% of the Plumbing Permit Fee Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1021 Plan Review Fee When the County Administers the Uniform Fire Code 100% of the Electrical Permit Fee Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1022 Plan Review Fee 75% of the Electrical Permit Fee Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1023 Plan Review Fee When the County Administers the Uniform Fire Code 100% of the Grading Permit Fee Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1024 Plan Review Fee 75% of the Grading Permit Fee Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1025 50 cubic yards (38.2 m3) or less No Fee

1026 51 to 100 cubic yards (40 to 76.5 m3) $28.52 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1027 101 to 1,000 cubic yards (77.2 to 764.6 m3) $44.90 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1028 1,001 to 10,000 cubic yards (765.3 to 7645.5 m3) $59.78 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1029 10,001 to 100,000 cubic yards (7646.3 to 76455 m3)

$59.78 for the first 10,000 cubic yards (7645.5 m3), plus 

$27.03 for each additional 10,000 cubic yards (7645.5 m3) 

or fraction thereof

Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1030 100,001 to 200,000 cubic yards (76 456 to 152911 m3)

$327.41 for the first 100,000 cubic yards (76455 m3), plus 

$16.08 for each additional 10,000 cubic yards (7645.5 m3) 

or fraction thereof

Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1031 200,001 cubic yards (152912 m3) or more

$488.23 for the first 200,000 cubic yards (152911 m3), plus 

$8.80 for each additional 10,000 cubic yards (7545.5 m3) or 

fraction thereof

Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1032 GRADING PERMIT FEES

1033 Issuance Fee $164.00 
Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130, 

Reso. No. 18-122
1034 50 cubic yards (38.2 m3) or less $28.52 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1035 51 to 100 cubic yards (40 to 76.5 m3) $44.90 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1036 101 to 1,000 cubic yards (77.2 to 764.6 m3)

$44.90 for the first 100 cubic yards (76.5 m3) plus $19.66 

for each additional 100 cubic yards (76.5 m3) or fraction 

thereof

Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1037 1,001 to 10,000 cubic yards (765.3 to 7645.5 m3)

$218.47 for the first 1,000 cubic yards (764.6 m3), plus 

$17.60 for each additional 1,000 cubic yards (764.6 m3) or 

fraction thereof

Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1038 10,001 to 100,000 cubic yards (7646.3 to 76455 m3)

$365.05 for the first 10,000 cubic yards (7645.5 m3), plus 

$74.13 for each additional 10,000 cubic yards (7645.5 m3) 

or fraction thereof

Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1039 100,001 or more

$1032.25 for the first 100,000 cubic yards (76455 m3), plus 

$41 for each additional 10,000 cubic yards (7645.5 m3) or 

fraction thereof

Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1040 MANUFACTURED HOME (Mobile Home) INSTALLATION FEES

1041 Issuance Fee $164.00 
Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130, 

Reso. No. 18-122
1042 Single Wide $242.75 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1043 Double Wide $364.12 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1044 Triple Wide $485.50 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1045 Electrical Fees $91.03 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1046 Plumbing Permit Fees $91.01 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130
1047 OTHER FEES
1048 Agricultural Building Exemption $97.10 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1049
Agricultural Building Exemption, if Constructed prior to Exemption 

Approval
$194.20 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1050 Water Reservoir Exemption Determination $242.75 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 08-130

1051 Education Fees 6% of building permit valuation AB717, Reso. No. 18-122

1052 Reinstatement of Permit $164.00 or 20% of original permit fee, whichever is greater
Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No.'s 08-130, 

18-122

1053 Minimum permit fee $164.00 
Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No.'s 08-130, 

18-122

1054 Inspections outside of Normal business hours (Special Inspection) See Special Inspection/Pre-Site Inspection Fees
Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No.'s 08-130, 

18-122

1055 Reinspection fees assessed under provisions of Section 305.8 $164.00 
Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No.'s 08-130, 

18-122

1056 Inspections for which No fee is specifically indicated (Special Inspection) See Special Inspection/Pre-Site Inspection Fees
Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No.'s 08-130, 

18-122

1057
Additional plan review required by changes, additions or revisions to 

approved plans (minimum charge - 1 hour)
$164.00 

Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No.'s 08-130, 

18-122

1058
Additional plan review required for MS4/LID standards (minimum charge 

- 1 hour)
Current weighted rate of Senior Building Inspector

Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No.'s 08-130, 

18-122

1059 Records Management
Current weighted rate of Staff Assistant 3- 1 hour-

Residential, 3 hours-Commercial
HSC Section 19852, Reso. No. 94-203, Reso. No. 18-122

1060 Planning Review of Building Permit Applications

Residential Submittal- Current weighted rate of Planner 

II, 1 Hour minimum  Commercial- Current weighted rate 

of Planner II, 2 Hour Minimum

Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No.'s 08-130, 

18-122

1061 Strong Motion Instrumentation Program (SMIP)

Group R-$10.00 per $100,000.00 of permit valuation, with 

appropriate fraction, Other-$21.00 per $100,000.00 of 

permit valuation, with appropriate fraction

Public Resources Code Section 2705

1062 General Plan Maintenance 0.65% of permit valuation Govt. Code Section 66014(b), Reso. No.'s 04-039, 11-072, 18-122

1063 Violation/Penalty Fees Pursuant to Mendocino County Code
Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No.'s 08-130, 

18-122

1064 Stormwater/BMP Inspection
$164.00 (after the fact) or $82.87 when combined with the 

issuance of a permit

Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Ord. No. 4313, Reso. 

No. 18-122

1065 Insulation Inspection
$164.00 (after the fact) or $82.87 when combined with the 

issuance of a permit
Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 18-122

1066 CASp Review $4.00 fee on each commercial/business plancheck AB1379, Reso. No. 18-122
1067 SPECIAL INSPECTION/PRE-SITE INSPECTION FEES

1068 Boonville $302.83 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 18-122

1069 Branscomb $423.34 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 18-122

DRAFT-REVISED JULY 12, 2021 12 Adopted by Resolution No. 21-XXX, Fees Effective as of August 15, 2021



Exhibit X

Line Fee Title Fee Amount Government Code Justification

County of Mendocino Master Fee Schedule

1070 Calpella $196.36 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 18-122

1071 Covelo $541.31 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 18-122

1072 Hopland $248.51 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 18-122

1073 Laytonville $389.16 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 18-122

1074 Leggett $512.91 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 18-122

1075 Longvale $334.85 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 18-122

1076 Navarro $383.76 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 18-122

1077 Philo $332.69 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 18-122

1078 Piercy $568.31 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 18-122

1079 Potter Valley $257.15 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 18-122

1080 Redwood Valley $216.57 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 18-122

1081 Talmage $208.08 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 18-122

1082 Ukiah $195.28 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 18-122

1083 Whale Gulch $708.57 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 18-122

1084 Whitethorn $708.57 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 18-122

1085 Willits $279.45 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 18-122

1086 Yorkville $359.30 Govt. Code Section 66016, HSC Sec. 19132.3, Reso. No. 18-122

1087 Planning Division

1088 Division of Land Project (**Add on fees may apply)

1089 Boundary Line Adjustment* (per parcel Add-on fee may apply) $1,098.00 + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a), Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1090 Certificate of Compliance $960.00  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a), Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1091 Major/Parcel Subdivision* (cost recovery applies) $7,728.00  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a), Reso. No.'s 11-072, 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1092 Subdivision Modification $2,883.00  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a), Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1093 Subdivision Extension of Time $353.00  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a), Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1094 Minor Subdivision $3,812.00  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a), Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1095 Subdivision Vesting of Tentative Map $2,878.45  +$90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a), Reso. No.'s 18-122, 19-170

1096 Subdivision Revised Map $2,095.55  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a), Reso. No.'s 18-122, 19-170

1097 Subdivision Exception to County Code $1,898.56  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a), Reso. No.'s 18-122, 19-170

1098 General Plan Project (**Add on fees may apply)

1099 General Plan/Coastal Plan Amendment* (cost recovery applies) $6,023.00  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a) Reso. No.'s 11-072, 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1100 Ordinance Amendment* (cost recovery applies) $6,871.00  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a) Reso. No.'s 11-072, 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1101 Rezone* (cost recovery applies) $4,342.00  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a) Reso. No.'s 11-072, 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1102 Development Agreement $5,406.00  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a) Reso. No.'s 11-072, 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1103 Development Agreement Modification $4,755.00  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a) Reso. No.'s 11-072, 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1104 Coastal Project (**Add on fees may apply)

1105 Categorical Exclusion $368.00  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1106 Coastal Development Permit  (CDP) Admin. Minor $1,707.00  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1107 CDP Admin. $3,214.09  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1108 CDP Admin. Renewal $725.89  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1109 CDP Standard $4,799.55  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1110 CDP Standard Renewal $1,024.58  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1111 CDP Standard Modification $3,129.62  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1112 CDP where Coastal Commission retains Authority $1,920.24  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1113 Emergency Permit $1,822.16  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1114 Mendocino Historical Review Board (MHRB) Major $1,198.00  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1115 Mendocino Historical Review Board (MHRB) Intermediate $869.09  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1116 Mendocino Historical Review Board (MHRB) Minor $491.78  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1117 Zoning Project (**Add on fees may apply)

1118 Use Permit - Minor $2,263.38  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1119 Use Permit - Minor Renewal/Modification $2,255.38  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a), Reso. No. 19-170

1120 Use Permit - Major* (cost recovery applies) $4,830.00  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1121 Use Permit - Major Renewal/Modification $3,144.53  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1122 Use Permit - Cottage Industry $ 2,190.59  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1123 Airport Land Use Commission Review $1,728.33  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1124 Airport Land Use Comm. Review - City Project $853.75 + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1125 Ag. Preserve Contract $3,323.47  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1126 Ag. Preserve Rescind and Re-enter $2,195.05 + $90.00 per hour Reso. No.'s 18-122, 19-170

1127 Home Occupation Business License $180.00

1128 Business License Review (zoning & occupancy) $339.00  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1129 Development Review* (cost recovery applies) $2,363.48  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1130 Flood Hazard Development Permit $465.00  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1131 Preapplication Conference $560.00  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1132 Surface Mining & Reclamation (SMARA) $7,120.00  + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1133 SMARA Renewal or Modification $3,812.00 + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1134 Variance $1,783.03 + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1135 Administrative Project

1136 Administrative Permit - Wireless Communication $1,986.00 + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1137 Administrative Permit $825.00 + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1138 Administrative Permit Renewal $100.00 + $90.00 per hour Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122, 19-170

1139 Other Project

1140 Private Road Naming $922.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1141 Misc. Project **Add On Fees

1142 Document Imaging (applies to every project) $111.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1143 General Plan Maintenance (applies to every project) $116.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1144 Environmental Review $735.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1145 Coastal Zone Review (Does not apply to "Coastal Projects") $941.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1146 MHRB Demo or Addition $869.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1147 SMARA Annual Inspection/Report $2,060.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1148 SMARA Exemption Determination $545.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1149 Vested Right Determination $3,564.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1150 Environmental Impact Report (EIR) Cost +15% Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1151 Special Planning Commission Hearing $1,619.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1152 Inclusionary Housing In-Lieu Fee Per MCC Chapter 20.238 Govt. Code 66014(a), Ord. 4219, Reso. No. 18-122

1153 Cell Tower GIS Add On $95.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1154 Violation Permit Amount Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1155 GMAC Referral Fee $185.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1156 Appeal to the Board of Supervisors $1616.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1157 Administrative Appeals $1,490.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1158 Code Enforcement Appeal $1,140.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1159 Application Update $436.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1160 Per Parcel Fee $403.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1161 Public Hearing $1,136.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1162 SMARA Extraction Multiple Sites $1,727.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1163 Admin Permit - Event/Gathering Add-On Fee $1,507.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1164 15% Fee Reduction to CDP Base Fee to construct SFR -$720.00 (CDP Standard) or -$482.00 (CDP Admin) Govt. Code 66014(a), Reso. No. 18-122

1165

1166 Cannabis Preliminary Review (Initial application only) $536.00 + $90.00 per hour Reso. No. 19-170

1167 Cannabis Pre- Application Meeting $519.00 + $90.00 per hour Reso. No. 19-170

1168 Cannabis Coastal Development Permit $5,826.00 + $90.00 per hour Reso. No. 19-170

1169 Cannabis Administrative Permit $1,261.00 + $90.00 per hour Reso. No. 19-170

Cannabis Projects

DRAFT-REVISED JULY 12, 2021 13 Adopted by Resolution No. 21-XXX, Fees Effective as of August 15, 2021



Exhibit X

Line Fee Title Fee Amount Government Code Justification

County of Mendocino Master Fee Schedule

1170 Cannabis Cottage Use Permit $2,220.00 + $90.00 per hour Reso. No. 19-170

1171 Cannabis Minor Use Permit $2,511.00 + $90.00 per hour Reso. No. 19-170

1172 Cannabis Major Use Permit $6,620.00 + $90.00 per hour Reso. No. 19-170

1173 Cannabis Major Use Permit Renewal/Mod $3,777.00 + $90.00 per hour Reso. No. 19-170

1174 Cannabis Variance $2,233.00 + $90 per hour Reso. No. 19-170

1175 Cannabis Minor Use Permit Renewal/Mod $2,148.00 + $90.00 per hour Reso. No. 19-170

1176 Cannabis Facilities Business License $421.00 + $90.00 per hour Reso. No. 19-170

1177

1178 Cannabis Business Tax Appeal Fee $341.82 Reso. No. 19-373

1179 Total Cannabis Business Tax Appeal Fee $1,194.72 Reso. No. 19-373

1180

1181 Annual Application Fee $881.00 Reso. No. 19-170

1182 Annual Permit & Compliance Inspection Fee $738.00 Reso. No. 19-170

1183 Cottage Annual Application Fee $881.00 Reso. No. 19-170

1184 Cottage Annual Permit & Inspection Fee $504 FY 19-20/ $738 FY 20/21 Reso. No. 19-170
1185 Second Application Fee (Same Owner & Property) $241.00 Reso. No. 19-170
1186 Cannabis Transferability Fee $333.62 Reso. No. 19-423

1187 Type 4 (Nurseries) Annual Permit & Compliance Inspection Fee $738.00 Reso. No. 19-170

1188 Service Fees

1189 Audio Reproduction Fee for Public Hearings $10.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1190 Zoning Letter $204.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1191 Map Reproduction/Miscellaneous Fees

1192 Quadrangle-combine with GIS Maps $35.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1193 GIS Maps/Population Info (per hour) $57.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1194 Custom Maps (per hour) $68.00 Govt. Code 66014(a),  Reso. No.'s 16-150, 18-122

1195 Probation

1196 Returned Check Fee $25.00 GC6157(b)

1197 Account Processing Fee $30.00 PC1205(e)

1198 Installment Payment Fee - Probation Fees $75.00 PC1205(e)

1199 Installment Payment Fee - Fines $50.00 PC1205(d)

1200 Restitution Collection Fee (15%) Varies PC1203.1

1201 State Restitution Fine 10% Collection Fee Varies Reso No. 11-072, PC 1202.4 WIC 730.6(q)

1202 Failure to Appear Fee $15.00 PC853.7(a), VC40508.5

1203 DMV Notification Fee $10.00 VC40508.6

1204 Adult Probation

1205 Monthly Drug Testing Fee (adults 21+ years) $33.00 Reso. No. 11-072, PC1203.1ab

1206 Juvenile Probation

1207 Sealing of Juvenile Records (age 26+ years) $150.00 WIC903.3

1208 Public Defender/Alternate Defender

1209 Legal Fees

1210 Registration Fee $50.00 Penal Code section 987.5

1211 Legal Services Cost Reimbursement

1212 Misdemeanor Cases $150.00 (flat fee) Penal Code section 987.8

1213 Felony Cases $175.00 (flat fee) Penal Code section 987.8

1214 Juvenile Delinquency Cases (initial petition plus post- judgment services) $80.00 per hour to maximum of two hours Welfare & Institutions Code section 903.1

1215 Mental Health Cases (Including LPS and probate conservatorships $80.00 per hour to maximum of two hours Welfare & Institutions Code section 5276

1216
Post-judgment services (modifications, expungements, in adult criminal 

cases (Non-specialty courts)
$80.00 (flat fee) Penal Code section 987.8

1217
Adult criminal and juvenile delinquency specialty court services, e.g., Drug 

Court, Prop 36 Court, etc.
$100.00 (flat fee) - in addition to ordinary fee

Penal Code section 987.8 & Welfare & Institutions Code section 

903.1
1218 Sheriff-Coroner

1219 Miscellaneous

1220 ABC License for Non-Profit, One-Day Events $13.00 Reso. No. 11-072

1221 Sheriff's Clearance Letter (Without Notary) $40.00 Reso. No. 11-072

1222 Sheriff's Clearance Letter (With Notary Certification) $60.00 Reso. No. 11-072

1223 Bingo Permit (unless Non-profit) $25.00

1224 Audio Cassette Tape, Per Copy $10.00

1225 Card Dealer’s License $50.00+ DOJ Fee §6.04.120 MCC

1226 Christmas Tree Permit One Tag Per Load (over 5 trees): $5.00 Per Tag §384d PC

1227 Circus, Carnival or Rodeo Permit $30.00 + DOJ Fee §6.04.050h MCC

1228 Explosives Permit, New & Renewal $10.00 §12101 H&S

1229 Explosives Permit, Less Than 100 Pounds $2.00 §12101 H&S

1230 False Alarms $35.00 MCC 8.60

1231 Fingerprint Services, Inked Cards, Per Card $20.00

1232 Fingerprint Services, LiveScan, Per Person $30.00

1233 Gambling Business Permit $100.00 + DOJ Fee §6.04.110 MCC

1234 Itinerant Business Permit $30.00 + DOJ Fee §6.04.090 MCC

1235 Jail Booking Fees (Local) $41.05
Reso. No. 11-098 (Effective July 1, 2011) if VLF Funding is not 

restored/State Budget; Gov. Code Sec. 29550
1236 Junk Business Permit $50.00 + DOJ Fee §6.04.130 MCC

1237 License to Carry Concealed Firearm, New & Renewal $100.00 + DOJ Fee §12054 PC

1238 License to Carry Concealed Firearm Amend/Modify/Replace License $20.00

1239 Marijuana Cooperative License Fee $1,500.00 Reso No. 10-109

1240 Medical Marijuana Card $0.00

1241 Marijuana Eradication See County Ordinance Chapter 9.31 of Title 9 for details GC 54985

1242 Zip Tie Program (Voluntary) $25.00 Reso. No. 10-195

1243 Zip Tie Program (Permitted) $50.00 Reso. No. 10-195

1244 Motor Vehicle Registration - Non Commercial $2.00 VC §9250.19

1245 Motor Vehicle Registration - Commercial $4.00 VC §9250.19

1246 Outdoor Festival Permit, Statement of Adequacy $50.00 + DOJ Fee §6.16.040e MCC

1247 Parade Permit (if Sheriff provides services): $30.00

1248 Search & Rescue $1,000.00 §26614.5 GC

1249 VHS Tape, Per Copy $15.00

1250 Impounded Vehicle Release $100.00 VC 22850.5

1251 Seizure, Storage, and Release of Firearms $80.00 PC 12021.3, FC 6389
1252 Third Party Inspector Authorization Permit - Commercial $1,500.00 Reso No. 10-109
1253 Third Party Inspector Authorization Permit - Individual $1,500.00 Reso No. 10-109

1254 Alcoholic Beverage Control License Review $176.00 GC 54985

1255 Photocopy of Reports

1256 Crime Reports

1257 Face Page Only: $2.50

1258 Property List (insurance), 1-9 Pages: $5.00

1259 Additional Pages Past 9, Per Page: $0.50

1260 Coroner's Reports

1261 First 9 Pages of Deputy’s Report: $10.00

1262 Post Mortem & Toxicology Reports: $15.00

1263 Additional Pages Past 9, Per Page: $0.50

1264 All Other Photocopies

1265 Minimum Charge, 1-9 Pages: $2.00

1266 Additional Pages Past 9, Per Page: $0.25

1267 Photographs

1268 First Photo, 3 ½ x 5 $10.00

1269 Each Additional 3 ½ x 5 Photo $1.00

1270 First Photo 8 x 10 $13.00

1271 Each Additional 8 x 10 Photo $3.00

Cannabis Program Fees

Cannabis Business Tax Appeal Fee

DRAFT-REVISED JULY 12, 2021 14 Adopted by Resolution No. 21-XXX, Fees Effective as of August 15, 2021



Exhibit X

Line Fee Title Fee Amount Government Code Justification

County of Mendocino Master Fee Schedule

1272 Identification Card Photographs $5.00

1273 Work Release Program Fees

1274 Sheriff’s Parole Supervisory Fee, Per Month $35.00

1275 Work Release Program

1276 Application Fee $35.00

1277 Daily Rate $10.00

1278 Transportation

1279 Land Improvement

1280 Tentative Map Fees

1281 Boundary Line Adjustment (for 2 parcels) $400.00 each Govt. Code 66451.2

1282 For each additional parcel $150.00 Govt. Code 66451.2

1283 Boundary Line Adjustment - Modification of Conditions $80.00 each

1284 Minor Subdivision $1,500.00 each

1285 Minor Subdivision - Revised Tentative Map (Substantive Revision) $300.00 each Govt. Code 66451.2

1286 Minor Subdivision - Modification Of Conditions $300.00 each

1287 Parcel Subdivision $1,430.00 each

1288 First 25 Lots $80.00 per lot

1289 Next 26 to 50 Lots $60.00 per lot

1290 Over 50 Lots $30.00 per lot

1291 Parcel Subdivision - Revised Tentative Map $700.00 each

1292 Parcel Subdivision - Modification Of Conditions $700.00 each Govt. Code 66000

1293 Major Subdivision $1,900.00 each Govt. Code 66451.2

1294 First 25 Lots $100.00 per lot Govt. Code 66451.2

1295 Next 26 to 50 Lots $75.00 per lot

1296 Over 50 Lots $40.00 per lot Govt. Code 66451.2

1297 Major Subdivision- Revised Tentative Map $700.00 each

1298 Major Subdivision- Modification of Conditions $800.00 each Govt. Code 66451.2

1299 Resubdivision or Reversion to Acreage $600.00 each Govt. Code 66451.2

1300 Resubdivision or Reversion to Acreage- Revised Tentative Map $260.00 each Govt. Code 66451.2

1301 Resubdivision or Reversion to Acreage- Modification of Conditions $300.00 each

1302 Brooktrails Boundary Line Adjustment $250.00 each Govt. Code 66451.2

1303 Plus per Parcel Fee $40.00 per lot Govt. Code 66451.2
1304 Other Planning Dept. Referral Fees (fee collected for DOT by DPBS)

1305
Use Permit/Coastal Development Permit/Development Review (Not 

Adjacent to Nor Taking Access from a County Road)
$90.00 Govt. Code 66000

1306
Use Permit/Coastal Development Permit/Development Review (Adjacent 

to or Taking Access from a County Road)
$150.00 Govt. Code 66000

1307
Minor Use Permit/Coastal Development Permit/Development Review 

(Adjacent to or Taking Access from a County Road)
$400.00

1308 Major Use Permit (Adjacent to or Taking Access from a County Road) $800.00

1309 General Plan Amendment $700.00 Govt. Code 66000

1310 Rezone $250.00 Govt. Code 66000

1311 Variance $160.00

1312 Conditional Certificate of Compliance $250.00 Govt. Code 66000

1313 Preapplication Conference Fee (per hour)(by Appointment) $80.00 Govt. Code 66000

1314 County Surveyor Checking Fees

1315 Research Assistant $50.00 per hour Govt. Code 54985 / Reso. No. 16-150

1316 GIS Map $50.00 per hour + printing fee Govt. Code 54985 / Reso. No. 16-150

1317 Record of Survey Map

1318 First Sheet $500.00

1319 Each Additional Sheet $150.00

1320 Record of Survey Map (Recheck)

1321 First Sheet $150.00

1322 Each Additional Sheet $80.00

1323 Parcel Map - Minor Subdivision

1324 First Sheet $1,600.00 Govt. Code 66451.2

1325 Each Additional Sheet $350.00 Govt. Code 66451.2

1326 Parcel Map - Minor Subdivision (Recheck)

1327 First Sheet $300.00

1328 Each Additional Sheet $100.00

1329 Parcel Map - Parcel Subdivision

1330 First Sheet $1,800.00

1331 Each Additional Sheet $450.00

1332 Parcel Map - Parcel Subdivision (Recheck)

1333 First Sheet $400.00

1334 Each Additional Sheet $140.00

1335 Final Map - Major Subdivision

1336 First Sheet $2,200.00

1337 Each Additional Sheet $450.00

1338 Final Map - Major Subdivision (Recheck)

1339 First Sheet $400.00

1340 Each Additional Sheet $130.00

1341 Resubdivision or Reversion to Acreage

1342 First Sheet $1,000.00

1343 Each Additional Sheet $140.00

1344 Resubdivision or Reversion to Acreage (Recheck)

1345 First Sheet $350.00

1346 Each Additional Sheet $100.00

1347 Miscellaneous Legal Description Review - County Surveyor $300.00 B&P Code 8726

1348 Miscellaneous Map Review - County Surveyor $400.00 B&P Code 8726

1349 Unilateral Agreement Review $750.00 Govt. Code 66451.2

1350 Improvement Fees

1351 Basic Improvement Inspection (Minor Subdivisions, Use Permits, Coastal Development Permits, Development Reviews, Reversions to

1352 Acreage, and Conditional Certificates of Compliance; when improvements are required, and the "Improvement Plan" process is not specified)

1353 First Inspection $200.00

1354 Each Additional Inspection $150.00

1355 Parcel Subdivision Improvement Inspection (When improvements are required, and the "Improvement Plan" process is not specified

1356 First Inspection (+$40 per lot) $300.00

1357 Re-inspection (+$4 per lot) $250.00

1358

Improvement Plan:

Specification Checking & Construction Inspection (Major Subdivisions, 

Parcel Subdivisions, Minor Subdivisions, Use Permits, Coastal 

Development Permits, Development Reviews, Reversions to Acreage, and 

Conditional Certificates of Compliance; When improvements are required 

to be completed through the "Improvement Plan" process

Four percent (4%) of approved engineer's cost estimate for 

streets and appurtenant facilities

1359 Subdivision Improvement Agreement Processing Fee $700.00

1360 Subdivision Improvement Agreement Amendment Processing Fee $500.00

1361 Subdivision Monumentation Agreement Processing Fee $400.00

1362 Subdivision Monumentation Agreement Amendment Processing Fee $300.00

1363 Road and Transportation Fees

1364 County Highway Encroachment Permit Fees

1365 Residential Driveway Approach $300.00

1366 Commercial Driveway or Private Road Approach $400.00

DRAFT-REVISED JULY 12, 2021 15 Adopted by Resolution No. 21-XXX, Fees Effective as of August 15, 2021



Exhibit X

Line Fee Title Fee Amount Government Code Justification

County of Mendocino Master Fee Schedule

1367 Excavation Permit (50 feet or less) $400.00

1368 Excavation Permit (more than 50 feet) Actual cost, minimum $550.00

1369 Add per foot over 100 feet $1.00

1370 Minor Pavement Patch/Repair (Up to 50 square feet) $150.00 SHC Section 1464, Reso. No. 16-150

1371 Major Pavement Patch/Repair (Over 50 square feet) $400.00 SHC Section 1464, Reso. No. 16-150

1372 Additional Permit Inspection (More than 3) per hour rate $75.00 SHC Section 1464, Reso. No. 16-150

1373 Minor Miscellaneous Permit $225.00 SHC Section 1464, Reso. No. 16-150

1374 Miscellaneous Permit $500.00

1375 Annual Permit (Utilities and Special Districts) $400.00

1376 Permit Time Extension $150.00 Reso. No.09-279

1377 Transportation Permit Fees

1378 Standard Permit $16.00

1379 Annual/Repetitive Permit $90.00

1380 Road Closure Requests

1381
Standard Road Closure Request Fee (One-time, first-time, or recurring 

events, which differ substantially from previously occurring event)
$200.00

1382
Recurring Road Closure Request Fee (Recurring events substantially the 

same nature as previous event)
$60.00

1383 Road Name Change Petition Fee

1384 Up to 10 properties $2,711.00 Reso. No's. 09-279, 10-050, 11-074

1385 Per 10 additional properties $154.40

1386 Per 1 additional hour of travel $66.45

1387 Per each additional sign $150.00

1388 Road Vacation Petition Fee

1389 Up to 10 properties $3,500.00 Reso. No. 16-150

1390 Summary Vacation $2,800.00 Reso. No. 16-150

1391 Per 10 additional properties $154.40

1392 Per 1 additional hour of travel $66.45

1393 Per each additional sign $150.00

1394 Airport Use Fees

1395 Little River Airport

1396 Tie-down, Single Engine, per Night $7.00

1397 Tie-down, Single Engine, per Month $40.00

1398 Tie-down, Light Twin, per Night $10.00 MCC § 8.64, Reso. No. 11-074

1399 Tie-down, Light Twin, per Month $60.00 MCC § 8.64, Reso. No. 11-074

1400 Tie-down, Heavy Twin, per Night $15.00

1401 Tie-down, Heavy Twin, per Month $90.00

1402 Private Portable Hangar, Single Engine, per Month $100.00 MCC § 8.64, Reso. No. 11-074

1403 Private Portable Hangar, Light Twin, per Month $105.00

1404 Private Portable Hangar, Heavy Twin, per Month $120.00

1405 Hangar Rental, Metal, Single Engine, per Month $200.00 MCC § 8.64, Reso. No. 11-074

1406 Hangar Rental, Metal, Light Twin, per Month $263.00

1407 Hangar Rental, Small Wooden, per Month $200.00 MCC § 8.64, Reso. No. 11-074

1408 Hangar Rental, Large Wooden, per Month $200.00 MCC § 8.64, Reso. No. 11-074

1409 Vehicle Parking, Automobile, per Month $30.00

1410 Vehicle Parking, Automobile, per Year $300.00

1411 Vehicle Parking, Recreational Vehicle, per Month $40.00

1412 Vehicle Parking, Recreational Vehicle, per Year $400.00

1413 Billboard Rental, Space, per Year $40.00

1414
Landing Fee, Large Aircraft (from 12,000 lb. up to and including 20,000 lb. 

landing weight)
$30.00 MCC § 8.64, Reso. No. 14-144

1415 Landing Fee, Large Aircraft ( ≥ 20,000 lbs. landing weight) $50.00 MCC § 8.64, Reso. No. 14-144

1416 Jet Parking, Per Night $50.00 MCC § 8.64, Reso. No. 14-144

1417 Transient Hangar Parking, per night $15.00 MCC § 8.64, Reso. No. 11-074

1418 Private Portable Hangar Agreement Transfer Fee $500.00 MCC § 8.64, Reso. No. 11-074

1419 After Hours/Call-Out Fee $100.00 - $200.00 MCC § 8.64

1420 Round Valley Airport Fees

1421 Hangar Rental, Metal, Single Engine, per Month $200.00 MCC § 8.64, Reso. No. 16-150

1422 Private Portable Hangar, Single Engine, per Month $35.00 MCC § 8.64, Reso. No. 11-074

1423 Private Portable Hangar, Light Twin, per Month $50.00 MCC § 8.64, Reso. No. 11-074

1424 Private Portable Hangar, Heavy Twin, per Month $80.00 MCC § 8.64, Reso. No. 11-074

1425 Private Portable Hangar Agreement Transfer Fee $500.00 MCC § 8.64, Reso. No. 11-074

1426 Tie-down, Single Engine, per Night $7.00

1427 Tie-down, Light Twin, per Night $10.00 MCC § 8.64, Reso. No. 11-074

1428 Tie-down, Heavy Twin, per Night $15.00 MCC § 8.64, Reso. No. 11-074

1429 Photocopy and Print Fees

1430 Photocopy (up to 8 1/2" x 14"), per page $0.10

1431 Photocopy (11" x 17"), per page $0.20

1432 Blue Print or Photocopy (up to 24" x 36"), per page $3.50 Govt. Code 54985, Reso. No. 16-150

1433 Reproducible Vellum Copy (up to 24" x 36"), per page $4.50 Govt. Code 54985

1434 DVD of Official Records $27.00 Govt. Code 54985, Reso. No. 16-150

1435 Postage and  Handling for Map/DVD, each (domestic) $5.00 Govt. Code 54985, Reso. No. 16-150

1436 Solid Waste

1437 One Garbage Can (32 gal.) (Each) $4.00

1438 One Cubic Yard $25.00 Reso. No. 09-077

1439 Large Demolition Load (Per Cubic Yard) $27.88 Reso. No. 09-077

1440
South Coast & Caspar Transfer Station Tires Equal to or Less than 19 

inches (Per Tire)
$3.00 Reso. No. 09-077

1441
South Coast & Caspar Transfer Station Tires Equal to or Less than 19 

inches with Rim (Per Tire)
$5.00 Reso. No. 09-077

1442
South Coast & Caspar Transfer Station Tires Greater than 19 inches (Per 

Tire)
$12.50 Reso. No. 09-077

1443
South Coast & Caspar Transfer Station Tires Greater than 19 inches with 

Rim (Per Tire)
$18.00 Reso. No. 09-077

1444
Boonville - Potter Valley - Albion Transfer Station Tires Equal to or Less 

than 19 inches (Per Tire)
$3.00 Reso. No. 09-077

1445
Boonville - Potter Valley - Albion Transfer Station Tires Equal to or Less 

than 19 inches with Rim (Per Tire)
$6.50 Reso. No. 09-077

1446
Boonville - Potter Valley - Albion Transfer Station Tires Greater than 19 

inches (Per Tire)
$18.25 Reso. No. 09-077

1447
Boonville - Potter Valley - Albion Transfer Station Tires Greater than 19 

inches with Rim (Per Tire)
$24.50 Reso. No. 09-077

1448 All Transfer Stations - Rear Farm Tractor Tire (Per Tire) $42.50 Reso. No. 09-077

1449 All Transfer Stations - Rear Farm Tractor Tire with Rim $46.00 Reso. No. 09-077

1450 South Coast & Caspar Transfer Station Freon Removal $3.00

1451 Boonville - Potter Valley - Albion Transfer Station - Freon Removal $6.50

1452
Solid Waste and Recyclable Material Collection and Transportation 

Permit Application Fee
$604.00

1453 Solid Waste Collection Franchise Fee 12% of Gross Adjusted Revenue (GAR) MCC § 9A.20.040

1454 Construction and Demolition Recycle Ordinance (Non-Refundable Fee) $370.00 Ord. No. 4174; MCC § 18.35.120

1455 Cathode Ray Tube Disposal Fee No Fee

1456 Consumer Electronics Recycling Fee No Fee

1457 Treasurer-Tax Collector

1458 Returned Check $25.00 GC 6157

DRAFT-REVISED JULY 12, 2021 16 Adopted by Resolution No. 21-XXX, Fees Effective as of August 15, 2021



Exhibit X

Line Fee Title Fee Amount Government Code Justification

County of Mendocino Master Fee Schedule

1459 Payment Plan Processing Fee $60.00 R&T 2922 (e)

1460 Research Fee $40.00 GC 54985

1461 Cost Charge $20.00 R&T 2621/2922 (e)

1462 Outdoor Festival (per day) $150.00 6.16.40

1463 Business License $40.00 6.04 ORD 4200

1464 Cannabis Facilities Business License $60.00 6.36 ORD 4394

1465 Release of Lien Fee $20.00 GC 6157

1466 Water Agency

1467 See Planning & Building Services

1468 # # #

1469 Cannabis Management Unit

1470 Cannabis Administrative Permit 1,548.08$ MCC 22.18

1471 Cannabis Minor Use Permit 2,681.06$ MCC 22.18

1472 Cannabis Minor Use Renewal/Modification 2,390.76$ MCC 22.18

1473 Cannabis Major Use Permit 4,974.86$ MCC 22.18

1474 Cannabis Major Use Renewal/Modification 4,035.83$ MCC 22.18

1475 Cannabis Variance 2,251.59$ MCC 22.18

1476 Cannabis Business Tax Appeal - Initial Fee 282.87$ 

1477 Cannabis Business Tax Appeal - Hearing Fee 1,131.95$ 

1478 10A.17 - Initial Application Review, Inspection, & Issuance Fee 1,648.59$ 10A.17

1479 10A.17 - Annual Renewal or Modification Fee 733.33$ 10A.17

1480 10A.17 - Appendix G 693.33$ 10A.17

1481 10A.17 - Nursery Add-On Fee (same owner & property) 369.49$ 10A.17

1482 Cannabis Transferability Fee 255.63$ 

1483 Cannabis Facility Business License 176.04$ 

1484 Cannabis Pre-Application Conference 493.20$ 

1485 Special Inspection Fee 448.49$ 

1486 Program Hourly Fee 90.00$ 

This Master Fee Schedule supersedes the prior fee schedule adopted December 17, 2019 by Resolution 19-423

DRAFT-REVISED JULY 12, 2021 17 Adopted by Resolution No. 21-XXX, Fees Effective as of August 15, 2021


